TABULATION

- ANNUAL BID # 2460 - RECYCLED STOCK & COPIER PAPER, ENVELOPES
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JUNE 11, 2013 AT 10:00 A.M.
FROM: NOVEMBER 1, 2013 TC: NOVEMBER 1, 2014 WITH TWO (2) RENEWAL OPTIONS ONE {1} YEAR EACH,
OPEN MARKET PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

VENDOR'S NAME EXECUTIVE FORMS STANDARD STATIONERY WESTERN BRW FAS CLAMPITT PAPER
ADDRESS ANNUAL 3848 N.W. 10th 8, 2251 FOSTER AVE,, 8301 E. STASSNEY LANE, B#g, S# 200 2700 N. McCOLL,
DESCRIPTION Ty, OKC, OK 73107 WHEELING, iL 60000 AUSTIN, TX, 78744 MCALLEN, TX. 78501
CS. {0171 423-9088 (B00) B70-1315 {877) 274-08568 (956) 618-5538
A [RECYCLED 25% COTYON PAPER j TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
{8) 81/2 X 11 8UB 24 25% COTTON While Linen 25 NC 8ID NO BID NO BID — $2,946.25
(b} 81/2 X 11 SUB 24 26% COTTON Ivory Linen 2 NG BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ATOTAL
B [RECYCLED ENVELOPES .
{8) #10 SUB 24 LITHO- WOVE - SIDE SEAM 100 0O BiD $5,010.00 NO BID $3,206.00
{b) #10 SUB 24 WINDOW.LITHO WOVE-SIDE 60 NO BID $3.681.00 NO BID $3,159.00
(c) Brown Kraft Cat ENVELOPES6 X8 Sub 2B 10miea $642.50 NG BID NO BID $383.50
(d} Brown Kraft Cat ENVELOPES 9 X 12 Sub 28 10miea $813.00 NO BID NO BID $583.30
(@) Brown Kraft Cai ENVELOPES 12 X 15 Sub 28 10miea $1,087.00 NO BID NC BID NQ BiD
{h Whita Catalog Env 6 X 9 Sub 28 1bmiea $628.00 NO BiD NOC BID $321.20
{2 White Catalog Env 9 X 12 Sub 28 10miea $795.00 NO BID NOBID $508,20
(h) Whita Catalog Env 10 X 15 Sub 28 19m/ea $939.00 NO BID NO BID 975,30
(i) A-6 vory Linen Env 4% X 6% Sub 70 Sm/fea NG BID NO BID NO BiD 338,40
{J) A-2 tvory Linen Env 4% X 5% Sub 70 Smiea NOQ BID NO BID NG 8iD 304.45
(k) A-6 While Linen Env 4% X 8% Sub 70 bmiea NO BID NO BID NQ BID $337.20
(I} A-2 White Linen Env 4% X 5% Sub 70 Bm/fea NO BID NO 8BID NO BID $301.40
{rmy #10 SUB 24 BLUE WINDOW 20 NOQ 8ID NO 8ID NO BID $1,391.00
{n}#98 Sub 24 CANARY 20 NO BID NOBID NO BID $1,114.40
B, TOTAL INC. INC. NO BID — $12,923.35
¢ INON-RECYCLED INDEX CARDS
(8) 8 X 11 SUB 110 WHITE INDEX 100m/tea NO BID NO BID NO 81D $2,238.00
{0} 8 X 14 SUB 110 WHITE [NDEX BCmiea NC BID NO BD NO BID $1,841.40
{c) 81/2 X 11 SUB 90 WHITE INDEX 50m/fea NC BID NQ BID NO BiD $944.00
(d) 8 1/ 2 X 14 SUB 90 WHITE INDEX 40m/lea NC BID NO BID NO BID $3,012.40
COLOR INDEX:
(8) 81/2 x 11 INDEX SUB 130 50miea NQ BID NO BID NQ BID $1,184.50
{f} 61/2 x14 INDEX SUB 110 25mfea NQ BID NG BID NO BID NO BiD
{a} 81/2 x 11 INDEX SUB 80 50m/ea NO BiD NQ BID NG 81D $1.000.00
(n} 8 42 x14 INDEX SUB 40 26miea NO BID NO Bip NOQ BID NO BID
ASTRO BRIGHT COLORS:
() 81/2x11 INDEX SUB 65 COVER 40m/ ea NO BID NO BID NQ BID $1,280.00
(i} 8 1/2 x 14 INDEX SUB 85 COVER 20m/ ea NO BID NQO BID NO 8D NO BID
ROYAL LINEN :
(k) 8 1/2 x 11 SUB 80 IVORY COVER 40mfea NOQ BID NO BID NO BID $1.,888.00
{) 812 x11 SUB 80 WHITE COVER 40miea NQ BiD NO BID NG BID $1,847.20
C. TOTAL NO 8IC NO B NO BID —+ 31323850
D [NCR NON-RECYCLED PAPER SUPERIOR
(@812 X 11 PRECOLLATED - 2 PART BO NO BID NO BID $6,068.00 $5,556,00
(b) 8 #/2 X 14 PRECOLLATED - 2 PART 30 NO BID NG 8D $2,855,00 $3.174.00
(¢) B 1/2 X 11 PRECOLLATED - 3 PART 40 NG BID NO BID $3.418.00 $3,138.00
(dl) 8 1/2 X 14 PRECOLLATED - 3 PART 10 NQ BiD NO BID $1,087.20 $1,184.50
(8} B1/2 X 11 PRECOLLATED - 4 PART 18 . NQ B NO BID $1,369.50 $1,257.75
{8 12X 14 PRECOLLATED - 4 PART 5 NOQ BiD NQ BID $681.00 $638.50
()8 1/2X11 CB WHITE 2 NO BID NO Bl $169.20 $176.80
{h} 8 1/2 X 11 C B CANARY 2 NO BID NO BID $133.60 $128.80
) D, TOTAL NO BID NO Bl $15,721.50 ~+ 315 264.55
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