FRO 20’1 5 ’fO MARCH 1 5 2016 W OPTEON TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR {1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

*VENDOR'S NAME TARGET $PECIALTY UNVAR USA CLARKE MOSQUITO ADAPCO
& 5042 SERVICE CENTER DR, 402 McBRIDE LANE, 875 SIDWELL COURT, 550 AERO LANE,
----- _ADDRESS SAN ANTONIQ, TX, 78218 | CORPUS CHRISTI, TX. 78408 $T. CHARLES, IL. 60174 SANFQRD, FL. 32771
__DESCRIPTION (80D} §26-3928 (361) 954-2181 (800) 523-5727 (B00) 3670859
o FRIGAL PRIGAL PRIGAL PRIGAL
NG BID NO BID NO BID —* 547948
NO BID NO BID NO BID —r 647344
NOBID NO BID , §74.00 e G530
NO BID NO BID — $51.53 NO BID
16,79 *2 $18,48 548,49 - $17.10
$21.50 £15.49 982,28 - 84738
$18.78 518,08 $47.62 e " 54886
59.00 *2 o $58.10 $386.11 $94,00
$92.40 — 50140 $221.69 $125.00
24,74 b 52405 264,74 $30.55
3607.40 —r  $B97.40 $657.40 S697.40
$440.00 — 244000 $440.00 $440.00
e GETOD $68.00 $101.08 $73.39
NO BED NG Bl NO BID 524385
$8.10 $2.15 $20.10 s $B09
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