ANNUAL BIDS # 2001 AIR CONDITIONER FILTERS

TABULATION

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JANUARY 23, 2014 AT 10:00 A.M.

FROM: AWARD DATE TO: FEBRUARY 11, 2015 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - EACH RENEWAL ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR.

VENDCR'S NAME JOE W, FLY DUSTLESS AIR FILTER FILTERS FIRST JOHNSTONE SUPPLY KOCH FILTER
& 2810 N. EXPR. 77, S# C 6634 MAPLERIDGE ST., 410 W. JACKSON, 4635 MAV ST., 625 W, HILL ST,
ADDRESS HARLINGEN, TX. 78552 HOUSTON, TX. 77081 HARLINGEN, TX. 78550 | BROWNSVILLE, TX, 78521 LOUISVILLE, KY. 40208
DESCRIPTION QTY. (956) 412-3234 (713) 666-4338 (956) 428-2622 (956) 838-0542 (502) 634-4796
A1 |FILTERS - REG. (12/CS.)) |PRIYR PRICE PR/CS. PRICE PR/CS. PRICE PR/CS. PRICE PR/CS. PRICE PR/CS.
1 |FILTERS 16x25x1" 40 $19.80 $16.80 $32.40 $13.20 $16.80
2 |FILTERS 16x20x1" 40 $19.80 $16.80 $27.60 $13.20 $16.80
3 |FILTERS 20x25x1" 40 $22.20 $25.44 $32.40 $14.40 $25.44
4 |FILTERS 12x12x1" 2 $15.00 $22.32 $38.40 $15.00 $22.32
5 [FILTERS 20x20x1" 40 $19.80 $16.80 $32.40 $13.20 $16.80
6 |FILTERS 20x25x2" 20 $29.40 $28.80 $50.40 $25.20 $28.80
7 |FILTERS 18x24x1" 20 $19.80 $25.44 $66.00 $18.00 $25.44
8 |FILTERS 12x24x1" 20 $19.80 $18.36 $33.60 $13.92 $18.36
B1 [GS-100 POLY MEDIA RL. PRICE PR, /ROLL PRICE PR. /ROLL PRICE PR. /ROLL PRICE PR. /ROLL PRICE PR. /ROLL
1 |GS-100 20X60°%2" 10 $39.00 $18.00 $82.00 $32.00 $18.00
2 |GS-100 15X60'X2" 10 $32.00 $12.66 $82,00 $34.00 $12.66
3 |GS-100 20X90'X1" 10 $39.00 $18.23 $82.00 $38.00 $18.23
C1 [FILTER METAL FRAMES PRICE PR/ EA PRICE PR/ EA PRICE PR/ EA PRICE PR/ EA PRICE PR/ EA
1 [16.75"X19.76" X 1" 16 $5.00 $10.00 $18.00 NO BID $10.00
2 |15.75" X 24.75" X 1" 26 $5.00 $10.00 $18.00 NO BID $10.00
3 |19.75" X 24, 75" X 1" 8 $5.00 $10.00 $21.00 NO BID $10.00
4 |19.75" X 29.75" X 1" 8 $5.00 $10.00 $26.00 NO BID $10.00
5 [15.75" X 19.75" X 2" 14 $5.00 $10.00 $26.00 NO BID $10.00
6 [19.75"X19.75"X 2" 14 $5.00 $10.00 $28.00 NO BID $10.00
7 |15.75"X24,75" X 2" 16 $5.00 $10.00 $28.00 NO BID $10.00
GRAND TOTAL PR/ YR. $6,284.00 — $6,039.14 $12,656.80 INC. $6,609.44
MISC. FILTERS % OFF 30% 45% NA 50% 74%
RECOMMENDATION —
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RTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRE/:T /BIDS RECEIVED:
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MICHAEL 'FORBES, ASST. AUDITOR / PURCHASING DATE

MARCELINO IBARRA, BUILDING MAINTENANCE DIRECTOR DATE
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