TABULATION

BUILDING SUPPLIES: ELECTRICAL - ANNUAL BID # 2000-2

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: JANUARY 3, 2014 AT 10:00 A.M.
FROM: JANUARY 23, 2014 TO: JANUARY 22, 2015 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (ONE) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL.

VENDOR ELECTRIC FIXTURE BUSH SUPPLY
ADDRESS 810 E. 11th. St, 2781 ROBINDALE RD.,
BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78522 BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78526
DESCRIPTION (956) 546-2401 (956) 831-3441
PRIMARY VENDOR - ELECTRICAL U/M | atypayr. Total pr/ yr. Total pr/ yr.
I. |FUSES
1|FRS-R-30 600 V RK TD 30 EA $180.00 $255.90
2]SC-15 600V CLASS G 30 EA $52.50 $97.80
3|FRN-R-30 250V TD 60 EA $276.00 $219.60
4]SC-30 300V CLASS G 30 EA $52.50 $162.00
5]SC-20 600V CLASS G 20 EA $35.00 $65.20
6|KTK-R-15 600V MINITURE 30 EA $255.00 $267.00
7IKTK-10 600V MINITURE 50 EA $125.00 $445.00
8|MDL-3 250V SMALL DIM 3A 250V SLOW BLOW 30 EA $18.00 $32.70
9|FRN-R-60 250V RK5 TD 60A 60 EA $270.00 $421.80
10]KTK-R-10 600V MINITURE 30 EA $225.00 $242.70
11JFRN-R-45 250V RK5 TD 20 EA $52.00 $140.60
12)FRN-R-150 250V RKS 20 EA $227.20 $695.00
13]FRS-R-100 600V RK TD 30 EA $570.00 $474.00
14JFRS-R-200 600V RKS5 20 EA $400.00 $695.00
SUB-TOTAL ITEM 1. —» $2,738.20 $4,214.30
II |SQUARE D BREAKERS
1JQO120SP-120/240V-20C 30 EA NO BID $127.50
2]D223NRB 100A-240V RT 5 EA NO BID $842.50
31Q0220 2P-120/240V-20A CB 30 EA NO BID $293.70
41Q0250 2P-120/240V-50A CB 15 EA NO BID $146.85
5]QOB120 SP-120/240V-20A CB 20 EA NO BID $478.60
6]QO115 SP-120/240V-15A CB 50 EA NO BID $212.50
71Q0130 SP-120/240V-30A CB 50 EA NO BID $212.50
§fHOM260 2P-120/240V-60A CB 20 EA NO BID $143.60
91Q02020 SP-2020A CB 15 EA NO BID $658.35
101QO816L.100S SFC LD-CNTR 10 EA NO BID $232.90
11JQOI112L125G LD CNTR 10 EA NO BID $241.40
12JQO120L125G LD-CNTR 5 EA NO BID $177.65
13]Q0O315 3P-240V-15A CB 15 EA NO BID $1,722.75
14JD221NRB 30A-240V3SN 5 EA NO BID $179.45
15{D224NRB 200A-240V RT 9 EA NO BID $1,145.35
16|D32INRB 30A-240V 4SN 5 EA NO BID $279.65
171Q0280 2P-120/240V-80A CB 5 EA NO BID $141.55
18|PK9GTA GRNDG BAR KIT 15 EA NO BID $38.25
19]D223N 100A-240V-3SN 5 EA NO BID $747.70
20{D322NRB 60A-240V-4SN-RT SW 5 EA NO BID $420.90
21]Q0370 3P-240V-70A CB 10 EA NO BID $594.90
22]Q0230 2P-120/240V-30A CB 15 EA NO BID $146.85
SUB-TOTAL ITEM 1I NO BID — $9,185.40

RECOMMENDATION ——f
| CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE OfI:IECT BIDS RECEIVED: %
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BUILDING SUPPLIES: ELECTRICAL - ANNUAL BID # 2000-2

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: JANUARY 3, 2014 AT 10:00 A.M.
FROM: JANUARY 23, 2014 TO: JANUARY 22, 2015 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (ONE) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL .,

ELECTRIC FIXTURE BUSH SUPPLY
810 E. 11th. St, 2781 ROBINDALE RD.,
BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78522 BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78526
(956) 546-2401 (956) 831-3441
( Continued) Primary Vendor - Electrical U/M | atypriyr. Total pr/ yr. Total pr/ yr.
ULICUTLER- HAMMER & ITE BREAKERS
__1ICH120 SP-20A-120V CB 50 EA $225.00 NO BID
2ICH250 2P-50A-240V CB 25 | EA $206.25 NO BID
3|CH230 2P-30A-240V CB 30 EA $247.50 NO BID
SUB-TOTAL ITEM III e $675.75 NO BID
IV IEMERGENCY LIGHT FIXTURES
CCS WHT EMERGENCY LIGHTING UNIT _10 | EA #lde.o0 $375.50
SUB-TOTAL ITEM IV —— S 122:50 $375.50
V_IMISCELLANEQUS
1312 BULK YELLOW WIRE CONNECTORS 500 20001 EA $160.00 $61.92
21512 BULK RED WIRE CONNECTORS 500 BAG 2000 EA $200.00 $/1.28
3]30-273 SIZE 73B ORANGE WIRE CONNECTORS | 10001 EA $120.00 $47.14
41 “ ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING 2000 EA $700.00 $/35.20
511" ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING 10001 EA $400.00 $621.18
6l1/2 4 EMT ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING 30001 FT $570.00 $674.70
714" DIECAST SET SCREW 300 | _EA $45.00 $58.32
_&I‘/z” ONE HOLE ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING | 300 | EA $36.00 $13.65
9]v500 RACEWAY WIREMOLD TUBING 300 | EA $36.00 $2.70
¥ ONE HOLE ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING | 300 | _EA $30.00 $40.62
103/8” BX METALLIC CABLE CONNECTORS 100 | _EA $00.00 $26.34
12047 EMT DIECAST SET SCREW CONNECTORS 300 | EA $75.00 $119.34
13147 EMT DIECAST SET SCREW CONNECTORS 300 | _EA $60.00 $98.32
141Vv504 WIREMOLD TUBING 2 HOLE STRAPS 50 EA $2.50 $12.50
LSICR20 NEMAS 20A IVORY DUPLEX 100 | EA $135.00 $127.84
" LIOUID TITE FLEXIBLE TUBING 300 |_EA $720.00 $144.75
171v700 RACEWAY WIREMOLD TUBING 100 I_EA $15.00 $9.70
18117 EMT DIECAST COMPRESSION COUPLINS 50 EA $12.50 $41.28
1915/8” RAISE SINGLE POLE PLASTER RINGS 50 EA $10.00 $19.69
RECOMMENDATION e
ERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE,THE,CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED: W
i [e [ty
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BUILDING SUPPLIES: ELECTRICAL - ANNUAL BID # 2000-2

A3 PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: JANUARY 3, 2014 AT 10:00 A.M.
FROM: JANUARY 23, 2014 TO: JANUARY 22, 2015 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (ONE) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL.

ELECTRIC FIXTURE BUSH SUPPLY
810 E. 11th. St, 2781 ROBINDALE RD.,
BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78522 BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78526
(Continued) Primary Vendor - Electrical (956) 546-2401 (956) 831-3441
V. [MISCELLANEOUS (CONTINUED) u/m Qty priyr. Total pr/ yr. Total pr/ yr.
20]'4” FEMALE CONDUIT CONNECTORS 100 | EA $15.00 31002
2114 X 4 BLANK COVER PLATES 100 I EA $30.00 $04.03
22]'2” REGULAR HANDYBOXES WITH _100 | EA $22.00 $57.50
23|SINGLE GANG BLANK COVERS 100 | EA $15.00 $20.80
DUPLEX RECEPTACLE QUTLET PLATES 100 I EA $20.00 $22.47
25]%” EMT DIE CAST SET SCREW CONNECTORS 100 |__EA $20.00 $21.00
26|z CONDUIT CLIPS KADDY 50 EA $2.50 $60.70
2714 SINGLE GANG KO HANDY BOXES 50 EA $10.00 $46.77
2814 X 4 JUNCTION BOXES 5" & % KO - 50 EA $50.00 $26.75
2914 X 4 JUNCTION BOXES %’ & % KO - DEEP 50 EA $75.00 $44.40
30133 + SUPER % X 66 FT3M TAPE 20 EA $74.00 $88.20
31]120V EYE PHOTQ CONTROL FIXED POSITION 10 EA $55.00 $92.90
32ISINGLE POLE 120/277V_SP20 A 50 EA $80.00 $77.07
33l WIREMOLD SINGLE GANG BOXES - SHALLOW 10 EA $5.00 $44.10
34]5/8” _GROUND ROD 10 EA $145.00 $122.00
35|FC6-1PC CRIMP ON COAX_CONNECTORS 50 EA $2.00 NO BID
_36]V511 2-IN 90D WIREMOLD FLAT ELBOWS 10 EA $4.00 $12.20
3704 X 4 % & % KO EXTRA DEEP JUCTION 30 EA $15.00 $26.62
_}_&'5/8” GROUND ROD CLAMPS 10 EA $24.50 $74.10
39]%” PVYC FEMALE CONNECTORS 50 EA $3.00 $TT9.50
ngz” PLASTIC INSULATION BUSHINGS 30 EA $12.00 1374
41|WIREMOLD FLUSH EXTENSION BOXES _10 EA $4.50 $48.00
42ISINGLE RECEPTACLE NEMAG-20R_WHIT/IV 50 EA $17.50 $986.27
43]25DTP-4 IV_10 FOOT POWER POLES 5 EA $173.50 ~ $622.55
441v517 2-3/4 WIREMOLD INTERNAL ELBOWS 5 EA $2.15 $7.70
45]v518 2-1/8 WIREMOLD EXTERNAL ELBOWS 5 EA $2.75 $7.85
1654 OCT 2-1/8 D QCTAGON JUNCTION BOXES | 20 EA. $15.00 $37.38
47135-YELLOW % X 66FT MARKING TAPE 10 | EA $11.50 $40.50
35-ORANGE % X 66FT MARKING TAPE 10 EA $11.50 $40.90
49]35-BROWN % X 66FT MARKING TAPE 10 EA $11.50 $40.90
SOIDUPLEX NEMAS 15R RECEPTACLE OUTLETS 50 EA $25.00 $18.92
51IPSAL] PLASTIC ANCHOR KITS W/ SCREWS 10 EA $75.00 $131.80
5212-IN SNAP-IN KO BLANK 10 EA $2.00 544906
53ISINGLE OUTLET PLATES 30 EA $4.80 $37.76
WHITE RANGE HOOD EXHAUST 5 EA $102.50 $228.50
55ISINGLE RECEPTACLE NEMAS-20R WHIT/IV 50 EA $25.00 $176.75
_54%” EMT DIE CAST COMPRESSION 50 EA $7.50 $34.85
571125V _40A TIMER 3 EA 30735 $488.40
58] WIREMOLD SINGLE GANG BOXES - SHALLOW 5 EA $2.75 $22.05
SUB-TOTAL ITEM V $3,973.40 $7,146.72
Miscellaneous Catalog Discount Trade Service - 80 % off list Trade Service - 50 % off list

RECOMMENDATION —_
| HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE, CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED: % %«’\
/e [1¢ M««Z
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TABULATION

BUILDING SUPPLIES: ELECTRICAL - ANNUAL BID # 2000-2

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: JANUARY 3, 2014 AT 10:00 A.M.
FROM: JANUARY 23, 2014 TO: JANUARY 22, 2015 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (ONE) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL.

ELECTRIC FIXTURE

BUSH SUPPLY

VENDOR
ADDRESS 810 E. 11th. St, 2781 ROBINDALE RD.,
BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78522 BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78526
DESCRIPTION (956) 546-2401 (956) 831-3441
SECONDARY VENDOR - ELECTRICAL UM | aty priyr. Total pr/ yr. Total pr/ yr.
I. |FUSES

1JFRS-R-30 600 V RK TD 24 EA NO BID $204.72
2|SC-15 600V CLASS G 24 EA NO BID NO BID
3JFRN-R-30 250V TD 48 EA NO BID $175.68
41SC-30 300V CLASS G 24 EA NO BID NO BID
51SC-20 600V CLASS G 16 EA NO BID $52.16
6]KKTK-R-15 600V MINITURE 24 EA NO BID $213.60
7|KTK-10 600V MINITURE 40 EA NO BID $356.00
8|MDL-3 250V SMALL DIM 3A 250V SLOW BLOW 24 EA NO BID $26.16
9JFRN-R-60 250V RK5 TD 60A 48 EA NO BID $337.44
10]KTK-R-10 600V MINITURE 24 EA NO BID $194.16
11|FRN-R-45 250V RK5 TD 16 EA NO BID $112.48
12]FRN-R-150 250V RKS5 16 EA NO BID $556.00
13]FRS-R-100 600V RK TD 24 EA NO BID $379.20
14]FRS-R-200 600V RK5 16 EA NO BID $556.00

—»  $3,163.60

SUB-TOTAL ITEM L

11

SQUARE D BREAKERS

SUB-TOTAL ITEM I

i

no secondary

no secondary

RECOMMENPATION

I HERE RTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THER C CT BIDS RECEIVED:
~ / b [

b
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BUILDING SUPPLIES: ELECTRICAL - ANNUAL BID # 2000-2

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: JANUARY 3, 2014 AT 10:00 A.M.
FROM: JANUARY 23, 2014 TO: JANUARY 22, 2015 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (ONE) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL.

ELECTRIC FIXTURE BUSH SUPPLY
810 E. 11th. St, 2781 ROBINDALE RD.,
BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78522 BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78526
(956) 546-2401 (956) 831-3441
( Continued) Secondary Vendor - Electrical UM | aty priyr. Total pr/ yr. Total pr/ yr.
III JCUTLER- HAMMER & ITE BREAKERS
SUB-TOTAL ITEM III no secondary no secondary
IV [JEMERGENCY LIGHT FIXTURES
CCS WHT EMERGENCY LIGHTING UNIT 8 EA NO BID $300.56
SUB-TOTAL ITEM 1V NO BID —» $300.56
V |MISCELLANEOUS
1§312 BULK YELLOW WIRE CONNECTORS 500 1600 EA NO BID $49.36
21512 BULK RED WIRE CONNECTORS 500 BAG 1600 EA NO BID $57.02
3]30-273 SIZE 73B ORANGE WIRE CONNECTORS 800 EA
500 BAG NO BID $37.75
4% “ ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING 1600 EA NO BID $588.16
1/2“ EMT ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING 2400 FT NO BID $1,492.23
5]1” ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING 800 EA NO BID $179.92
6]'2" DIECAST SET SCREW 240 EA NO BID $46.66
712" ONE HOLE ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING | 240 FT
STRAP NO BID $10.92
8{V500 RACEWAY WIREMOLD TUBING 240 EA NO BID $216.00
9%+ ONE HOLE ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING | 240 EA
STRAP NO BID $32.50
10§3/8” BX METALLIC CABLE CONNECTORS 80 EA NO BID $21.07
11}%4” EMT DIECAST SET SCREW CONNECTORS 240 EA NO BID $95.47
125" EMT DIECAST SET SCREW CONNECTORS 240 EA NO BID $46.66
13]V504 WIREMOLD TUBING 2 HOLE STRAPS 40 EA NO BID $10.00
14JCR20 NEMAS5 20A IVORY DUPLEX 80 EA NO BID $102.27
15{'2” LIQUID TITE FLEXIBLE TUBING 240 EA NO BID $115.32
16§V700 RACEWAY WIREMOLD TUBING 80 EA NO BID $77.60
171 EMT DIECAST COMPRESSION COUPLINS 40 EA NO BID $33.02
18]5/8” RAISE SINGLE POLE PLASTER RINGS 40 EA NO BID $15.75

RECOMMENDATION —>

7
| HE&W TIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE RAECT BIDS RECEIVED: /
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BUILDING SUPPLIES: ELECTRICAL - ANNUAL BID # 2000-2

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: JANUARY 3, 2014 AT 10:00 A.M.
FROM: JANUARY 23, 2014 TO: JANUARY 22, 2015 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (ONE) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL.

ELECTRIC FIXTURE BUSH SUPPLY
810 E. 11th. St, 2781 ROBINDALE RD.,
BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78522 BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78526
(Continued) Secondary Vendor - Electrical (956) 546-2401 (956) 831-3441
V. |[MISCELLANEOUS (CONTINUED) U/M | atypriyr. Total pr/ yr. Total prf yr.
19 1/2" EMT CONNECTORS, SET SCREW, STEEL 80 EA NO BID $10.34
20§14 X 4 BLANK COVER PLATES 80 EA NO BID $19.22
21}2" REGULAR HANDYBOXES W/ KNOCKOUTS 80 EA NO BID $45.64
22|SINGLE GANG BLANK COVERS 80 EA NO BID $23.26
23]DUPLEX RECEPTACLE OUTLET PLATES 80 EA NO BID $17.98
241%” EMT DIE CAST SET SCREW CONNECTORS 80 EA NO BID $15.55
25|'%.” CONDUIT CLIPS KADDY 40 EA NO BID $48.56
26]'2” SINGLE GANG KO HANDY BOXES 40 EA NO BID $37.41
2714 X 4 JUNCTION BOXES 4”& %" KO - 40 EA NO BID $21.39
28]4 X 4 JUNCTION BOXES ¥ & %" KO - DEEP 40 EA NO BID $35.49
29133 + SUPER % X 66 FT 3M TAPE 16 EA NO BID $70.56
300120V EYE PHOTO CONTROL FIXED POSITION CELLS 8 EA NO BID $74.32
31YSINGLE POLE 120/277V SP20 A 40 EA NO BID $62.38
32{WIREMOLD SINGLE GANG BOXES - SHALLOW 8 EA NO BID $35.28
33}5/8” GROUND ROD 8 EA NO BID $97.60
34]FC6-1PC CRIMP ON COAX CONNECTORS 40 EA NO BID NO BID
350V511 2-IN 90D WIREMOLD FLAT ELBOWS 8 EA NO BID $9.76
3604 X 4 V2”& ¥ KO EXTRA DEEP JUCTION BX | 24 EA NO BID $21.30
3715/8” GROUND ROD CLAMPS 8 EA NO BID $9.12
38]%" PVC FEMALE CONNECTORS 40 EA NO BID $9.55
39§2” PLASTIC INSULATION BUSHINGS 24 EA NO BID $10.99
40l WIREMOLD FLUSH EXTENSION BOXES 8 EA NO BID $35.28
41|SINGLE RECEPTACLE NEMAG-20R WHIT/IV 40 EA NO BID $789.02
42125DTP-4 IV 10 FOOT POWER POLES 4 EA NO BID $498.04
43]V517 2-3/4 WIREMOLD INTERNAL ELBOWS 4 EA NO BID $6.16
444V518 2-1/8 WIREMOLD EXTERNAL ELBOWS 4 EA NO BID $6.28
45[165 4 OCT 2-1/8 D OCTAGON JUNCTION BOXES % KO 16 EA NO BID $29.91
46135-YELLOW % X 66FT MARKING TAPE 8 EA NO BID $32.72
47135-ORANGE % X 66FT MARKING TAPE 8 EA NO BID $32.72
48]35-BROWN % X 66FT MARKING TAPE 8 EA NO BID $32.72
49 DUPLEX NEMAS5 15R RECEPTACLE OUTLETS 40 EA NO BID $15.14
50{PSA1J PLASTIC ANCHOR KITS W/ SCREWS 8 EA NO BID $105.44
51J2-IN SNAP-IN KO BLANK 8 EA NO BID $17.98
52|SINGLE DUPLEX RECEPTACLE OUTLET 24 EA NO BID $30.21
53|REGULAR RESIDENTIAL 36" RANGE HOOD WH/IV 4 EA NO BID $182.80
54)SINGLE RECEPTACLE NEMAS5-20R WHIT/IV 40 EA NO BID $92.92
55[4" EMT DIE CAST COMPRESSION CONNECTORS 40 EA NO BID $27.91
56{125V 40A TIMER 2 EA NO BID $325.66
S7TYWIREMOLD SINGLE GANG BOXES - SHALLOW 4 EA NO BID $17.04
SUB-TOTAL ITEM V NO BID —>» $6,181.33
Miscellaneous Catalog Discount Trade Service - 80 % off list Trade Service - 50 % off list

RECOMMENDATION —>
i HEW THE ABOVE TO BE THE CQRRECT BIDS RECEIVED: J% @/
. jle /Y
TAN R
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