ANNUAL BIDS - LUBES, OILS, GREASES 8 ANTL.FREEZE. ¢ 1993
AS PER BIDS RECEWED ON FEBRUARY 5, 2013, AT 10:00 AM.

FROM: MARCH 31, 2013 TO: MARCH 30, 2014 WIOPTION 10

OPEN MARKET FPRICE INCREASES ALLOWED.

TABULATION

RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE {1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

BINDER'S NAME J & BINDUSTRIES QUALITY STANDARD PRTROLEUM ARGUNQEGUI OIL PATCH FUEL VALLEY LUBRICANTS
AND P.0. BOX 1718, 6245 BROOKHILL DR, $# 2 4506 HWY 358, 1805 BAYQU COLRT RD., 17656 Sk 48,
ADDRESS SAN BENITO, TX. 78586 HOUSTON, TX 77087 LAREDOQ, TX, 78043 BROWNSVILLE, TX, 78526 BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78521
DESCRIPTION MONTHLY {858} 749-9585 8323747262 (956) 7225251 {56) 5314839 (856) 831-4125
USALE totel price iofsl price total prico lols! price Iolal price
CATEGORY A:
1. Englne OF 5w30 apl-sn 250 gls NO BID $2,800.00 $1,502.50 81,847 50 $1,603.00
2, £ngino O 5wa0 api-th 1/55p! NO BID $624.10 $350.28 5478.56 $407.10
3. Engine Oll 15w40 epi-cpd 250 gis NO BID $3,037.50 £1,675.00 $1.847.50 $1.647.50
4. Enging OF $5w40 api-cp4 4155q1 NO BID $680.36 $360.50 §524.19 $416.94
&, Gear QI1B5140_B5w-140 aplgi5 ‘ 5156t $2.557.50 $331 .93 T $212.82 £305.25 $240.51
6. Dextron [fl - ATF 1 T aagis NO BID $912.50 - $4E9,60 $649.18 $555.00
7. Dexiron Il - ATF " 5issgl NO 8 $307.18 T $168.40 $204.85 $210.13
8. AW. Hydraulic O $0.68 HFO —4I65g! NO BiD §564.20 N $316.38 $660.63 £156.94
0. Universa! Tractor Fluid J20 cod T naghs NO 8iD $1,11947 o $539.75 $7BAAT $519.17
" 110, Univarsal Tractor Fluid 20 co-4 ST sl NO BID §372,83 RENR $184.6) $305.05 $194.97
1. Graase NLGT -2 Mulll Perp EP2 Lilhlum Se816019's NO BID $93.78 343.25 $61,00 $44.00
12. Groase NLGT-2 Mulll Purp,EPZ Lilhium 70 Ths NG BID $210,00 R §11543 $14040 §94.32
13, Brake Fiuld - Col 3 T 1z qgte, NO BID . $34.58 i $40.69 §52.48 $T1.04
14. Bfake Fluid - Dol 3 il 20 gls. NCBID - §116,20 NI $281.R0 $950.20 £400,60
(45 Power Steering Fluid - Reg. . 4B gts. NO BID ; £138,24 i 1 $120,80 §72.96 $216,85
"B Antifreeze - Green - Requior Tl Taoqls NO BID ] o $630.00 5246.40 $276.03 $451.20
17 Anli-ireeze - Deq Cool 1008 T NOBID ‘o $850.00 v $574.68 549140 $1.112,80
T ITOTAL PRICE R INC, i R $12.96541 | e 3726160 36.081.63 $8,546,30
" [Mibe. Cubos, Qils, Greases i S 1% %% - 0% 10% 0%
“[cArEGeORY B! i
1, Depraeses & Tar Removey o Ghals ——e  SITT20 $46.20 NO BID ND BIO
" 2. Pors Gieaner: T .
A = Pans Clesner (once per month) ~10gl tank NO BD - B NQ BID NOD BID NO BIR
B - Brake Claaner (once per 3 monits) . 1.75pte NO 810 - NO 8ID NG BID NQ BID
262 Industriel Griv, Post faabel, Tx
RECOMMENDATION —
{ HEREBY CERIHY THE ABOVE Y0 BE THE CORREGT BIDS RECEIVED.
2fiz fi3
MICHAEL FGREES, ASST. AUDITORIPURCHASING ' DATE Paga 1

Tarched o S Conan. £k @Q/%'/QG 3



