## **TABULATION**

ANNUAL BIDS - SOLID WASTE DISPOSAL # 1970 - PARKS DEPT. AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: MARCH 26, 2013 AT 10:00 A.M.

FROM: APRIL 11, 2013 TO: APRIL 10, 2014 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

	VENDOR WITHDREW BID - SEE ATTACHED							
VENDOR'S NAME	WASTE MG/MT. OF SOUTH TEXAS						ALLIED WASTE	
&_	1777 N.E. LOOR 410, S# 1001				9402 W, EXPR, 83.			
ADDRESS	SAN/ANTONIO, TX. 78217				•			
DESCRIPTION	/ (210) 619- <del>7</del> 756				HARLINGEN, TX. 78552			
	1 DUMP/WK	2 DUMP/WK	3 DUMP/WK	4 DUMP/WK	1 DUMP/WK	2 DUMP/WK	(956) 423-7316 3 DUMP/WK	4 5 1 1 5 1 5 1
	MONTHLY PRICING	MONTHLY PRICING	MONTHLY PRICING	MONTHLY PRICING	MONTHLY PRICING	MONTHLY PRICING		4 DUMP/WK
2 YD. CONTAINER	\$47.00	<b>\$95.00</b>	\$142.00	\$190.00	\$80.59		MONTHLY PRICING	MONTHLY PRICING
3 YD. CONTAINER	\$71.00	\$142.00	\$214.00	\$285.00		\$161,21	\$241,80	NO BID
4 YD. CONTAINER	\$95.00	\$190.00	\$285.00	<del></del>	\$92.29	\$184.56	\$276,84	NO BID
6 YD. CONTAINER		/ 4100.00	\$203.00	\$380.00	\$95.45	\$190,89	\$286.34	NO BID - rev \$322,36
8 YD, CONTAINER	····	/	<u> </u>		\$146.01	\$292.03	\$438.04	NO BID
DELIVERY FEE	N/C	N/C			\$157.68	\$315.38	\$473.07	NO BID
RENTAL FEE	N/C	N/C	N/C	/ N/C	N/C	N/C	N/C	N/C
DISPOSAL FEE	N/C	N/C	N/C	N/C	N/C	N/C	N/C	N/C
HAUL FEE	N/C		N/C	N/C	N/C	N/C	N/C	N/C
Formula;	14/0	N/C	N/C	N/C	N/C	N/C	N/C	N/C
9 ea - 4yd /1 d pr/wk	\$95.00 x 9 = \$ 855.00							
17 ea - 4yd /4 d pr/wk	493.00 X 8 7 \$ 655.00				\$95.45 x 9 = \$ 859.05			
Total	ļJ			\$380.00 x 1X = \$ 6,460.00				rev - \$322.36 x 17 = \$5,480.12
	\$7,315.00				INC rev \$ 6,339.17			
30 YD. CONTAINER - DELIVERY FEE	r /	\$1	50.00		<u> </u>			
30 YD. CONTAINER - RENTAL FEE PER/MONTH	\$150.00				\$100.00			
30 YD. CONTAINER - DISPOSAL FEE(PER/TON)	\$130,00				\$159.28			
30 YD. CONTAINER - HAUL FEE/HAUL (PULL RATE)	7/				\$32,47			
The state of the s	\$200,00				\$239,07			

RECOMMENDATION

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:

MICHAEL FORBES, ASST. AUDITOR / PURCHASING DATE

JAVIER MENDEZ, PARKS DIRECTOR

Awarded by Comm Ct 04/11/2013

DATE