ANNUAL BID #1444 - GENERATOR REPAIRS

TABULATION

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON NOVEMBER 6, 2013 AT 10:00 AN,
FROM: JANUARY 21, 2014 TO: JANUARY 20, 2015 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - EACH RENEWAL ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR,
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VENDOR'S NAME HOLT STEWART & STEVENSON ATLAS TECHNOLOGIES
& 3302 8. W. W, WHITE RD,, 2701 N. CAGE BLVD, 7020 N, 16th ST,
ADDRESS SAN ANTONIO, TX, 78222 PHARR, TX. 78544 MC ALLEN, TX. 78504
PESCRIPTION 210-648-1111 956-787-6880 958-240-1621
QTy. UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT #RICE TOTAL

LABOR - STRAIGHT TIME HOURS 38 $11000 _ $4,180.00 $146.00 $5,548.00 $92,00 $2,622.00
LABOR - OVER-TIME HOURS 18 $165.00  $2,640.00 $219.00 $3,504.00 $138.00 $2,208.00
LABOR - OVER-TIME PREMIUM HOURS 11 $22000  $2,420.00 $292.00 $3,212.00 $138.00 $1,518.00
TRIP-TRAVEL TOTAL {(MILEAGE & SALARY) 500 $3.50 $1,750.00 $3.50 $1,750.00 $1.75 3657.00
PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE SERVICE 10 each $18,350.00 — $18,082.85 $23,936.00
PARTS $6,740 list $6,740.00 $9,436.00 $6,055,00
RENTALS: PR/WEEK Wi/ DELIVERY, SET-UF , REMOVAL
100 KW GENERATOR 1 $3,200.00 $1,788.00 NO BID
250 KW GENERATOR i $4,300.00 $2,203.00 NO BiD
400 KW GENERATOR 1 $5,000.00 $3,138,00 NO BID
750 KW GENERATOR i $9,100.00 $8,682.00 NO BID
1,000 KW GENERATOR t $10,700.00 $9,849.00 NOC BID
1,400 KW GENERATOR 1 $13,700.00 $11,381.00 NO BID
TOTAL $82,080.00 — $78,523.85
RECOMMENDATION —

| HEREBY ZERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THME CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:
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