TABULATION

ANNUAL BID #1425 - FIRE ALARM SYSTEMS INSPECTION & REPAIRS
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JULY 8, 2014 AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM; AWARD DATE TO: JULY 2, 2015 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - EACH RENEWAL ONE {1) ADDITIONAL YEAR.

VENDOR'S NAME . SUPERIOR ALARMS ARGUS CIRCLE NDUSTRIES
& 00 ASH AVENUE, 314 ASH AVENUE, 815 WEST TYLER,
ADDRESS MCALLEN, TX. 78501 MGALLEN, TX. 78501 HARLINGEN, TX, 78550
DESCRIPTION | (958) 6B2-6005 {956) 682-8344 (058) 423-2836
INSPECTION | INSPECTIONS INSPECTICN
ONLY -2 INCLUI:)tNG ONLY - 2 PRIYR| INSPECTIONS INSPECTION INSPECTIONS
PRIYR & 4 REPAIR REPAIRS ONLY - TOTAL- &1 INGLURING REPAIRS ONLY - TOTAL CHLY - 2 PRIYR INCLUDING REPAIRS ONLY - TOTAL-

SENSITIVITY SER\/:ICE PARTS+LABOR+Y] INSPECTIONS + SENSITIVITY | REPAIR SERVICE | PARTSH+ASOR+ | INSPECTIONS + { | 81 SENSITIVITY . REPAIR SERVICE | PARTS+LABOR+T| INSPECTIONS +

TEST PRIYR AGREEMENT TRIP REPAIRS P4+L+T YEST PRIYR AGREEMENT TRIP REPAIRS P+1+T TEST PRIYR AGREEMENT RiP REPAIRS P+L+7T
A. Gamewall Worid Wide -1 - La Feria - Annex $205.00 NO BID $4,625.00 $5,120.00 $300.00 [+ $2,200.00 $4,434.00 $4,724.00 $1,800.00 $5.,500.00 $5,120.00 $6.,920.00
8. Nolifier - 6 - Bro. - Lucio Clinic & Dancy , DC2,

$13,700.00 | NOBID $18,305.00 |  $32,005.00 $6,200.00 [-*$$7,20000 | $15258.00 | $21,468.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID
£.1, Annex & O'Brien, Hgn Annex :
C. Siemens - 2 - San Benito - Hester(New),Bro. - DG 1 | $13,20000 { NOBID NO BID NO 81D $3,530.00 [+ $13,400.00 $5,818.00 $¢,148.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID
ghr-fzgﬂ?]:;bems " - Se0 Bonilo Heslar Oid, Cam. Perk | ¢ 60000 | NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,300.00. [+ $0,20000 | $13,16200 | $15462.00 NO 8ID NO BID NO BID NG BID
£. Radionlcs - 1 - $an Benlto - Boot Camp $1.30000 |  NOBID $4,018.50 §5,318.50 $600.00 —-* $2,800.00 $3,674.40 $4,271.40 $1,800,00 $0,820.00 $4,263.00 $6,063.00
F. Security Inll. - 2 - San Benito - Adull Prob., $8,00000 | NOBID $5,932.00 $13,832.00 $2,700.00 1> $9,100.00 $5,102.80 $7,602.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8ro - Social Service Centar Browne H
G, Edwards - 2 - Olmito - Sheriff's Dep!, Rucker Jall | $49,500.00 NOBID NO BID NOBID $6,350.00 ~* $11,000.00 $9,975.80 $16,325,80 $54,000.00 | $82,375.00 $12,141.00 $66,141.00
H.-1 . ADT $an Benito Annex - Levi's Bidg, NO BID NO BID NO 8ID NO BID $660.00 $3,500.00 $12508.80 | $13,106.80 NO 8iD NO BID) NO 8ID NG BID
MISG - 2 - Juv. Orange St Cenlro Cuttural NC BID NOBID NO BID NG BID $800.00 [+ $5,800.00 $6,401.80 $7,201.80 NO 8ID NO BID NO 810 NG BID
Cat1=ABCDF woF : $42,000.00
Cat1=ABCDF wF i $51,000,00
Cat2 = E,G i $13,800,00 $92,195.00
Catd=H racommendation TXMAS Interlocal: TYCO
Cat 4 = Misc l 1 | $5,600.00
REGOMMENDATION *

{No site visitvenification - Security Intl, Turnkey) (No Certifications - Turnkey}

ERTIFY THE ABOVE 70 BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:
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TABULATION

ANNUAL BID #1425 - FIRE ALARMW SYSTENMS INSPECTION & REPAIRS
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JULY 8, 2044 AT 11:00 AWM.
FROM: AWARD DATE TO: JULY 2, 2015 WIOPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE « EACH RENEWAL ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR.

VENDOR'E NAME ss¢umw INTERNATIONAL JURNKEY COMMUNICATIONS
& i P.O.BOX 2550, 4220 BICENTENNIAL DR, 5#D
ADDRESS EDINBURG, TX. 78540 MeALLEN, TX, 78504
DESCRIPTION | (958)381.-8BE (656 686-1986
WMGPECTION INSP,E:CTIDNS NSPECTION
Gy -2 INGLUIDING OHNLY - 2PRIYR]  INSPECTIONS
PRIAYR & 1 REPAR REPAIRS QNLY - TOTAL &1 INCLUGING REPAIRS ONLY - TOTAL:
SENSITWITY SEQVICE PARTEHLARDR| INBPECTIONS + SENSITIVITY | REPAIR BERVICE | PARTIHABOR | INSPEGTIONS +
TEST PRIYR AGRéCMENT IRIF REFAIRSG P+ T§§T PRIYR, AQREEMENT TRIE REPAIRS PeisT
A, Gamewel World Wige -1 - La Feria - Annex HO BID NO BID NG BID NO 21D £600.00 $4,310.00 $3,710.00 $4,310.00
. Motifar - 6 - Bra, - Lugio Clinle & Dancy , DC2,
NO BID NO B NO B HOBID H02.0 882,00 13,740, 582
B 1. Ana & O'Brien. ko A 0§¥3D 8D 33.902.00 $17.682 $13,780.00 | $17.68200
C. Siemens - 2 - San Benilo - Hesler(New),8re. - DC £ | NOBID N0 BID NG BID NOBID $3,004.00 $7,866.00 $4,856.00 £7.856.00
R T id, Cam. Park :
D.-2- Gerberus - - San Renllo Hester Old, Cam. Parky o NOBID NG BID NO BID $290000 | $13.02000 | $10.82000 | $3.020.00
Shrf. Annex :
E. Radionics - 1 - San Benito - Bool GCamp RO I NG BIL NG BID NO BID §1,200,00 $4,326.00 $2,920.00 $4,129.00
£, SBacurity intl. - 2 - 8an Bonfta - Aduit Prob., .
Bro . Socll Service Center Browne NO BID 5650,00 . $5.261.75 iNG. NO BID NO BID NG BID NEY BIG
. Edwards - 2 - Olmllo - Sheriffs Depl, Rucker Jail NO 8ID NOBID NO 8I0 NOBID $1,200.00 $5,338.00 $4,138.00 $5,338.00
H. -1 - ADT San Benjto Annex - Levls Bidg. NQBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $800.00 $14,158.00 $10.358.00 | $11,158.00
MISG - 2 - Juv. Orangs St., Cenlro Culturat NG BID NOLBID NO BID NO BID $1,200.00 $6,823.00 $5,883.00 £7,063.00
Catt=ABCDE WoF f $42,858.00
Catt=ABCRF wF : Inc-ne F
Cal2=E0 inc - withdrew 3
Catd=H recommiendation TXMAS ntorlacat: TYGO
Catd = Misc 1 ] £6,623,00

_ RECOMMENDATION T
{No site vfsj:rveriﬂcaficn ~ Securty Inlt, Tumkey) (No Certiflcations ~ Tumnkey) (Turnkey withtrew Cat 6 )
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