TABULATION

PICK -UP TRUCKS (QTY. 4), PATROL CARS (QTY. 4), VAN (QTY. 1) - BID # 170102 - VARIOUS DEPTS.
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON FEBRUARY 14, 2017 AT 11:00 A.M.

VENDOR'S NAME RODRIGUEZ FORD TIPTON FORD SILSBEE FORD CALDWELL COUNTRY CHEV. GRAPEVINE DCJ
& 13752 LUPINE RD., 3840 N. EXPRESSWAY 77, 1211 HWY. 96N, P.0. BOX 27, 2601 WILLIAM TATE,
ADDRESS LYFORD, TX. 78569 BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78523 SILSBEE, TX. 77656 CALDWELL, TX. 77836 GRAPEVINE, TX. 76051
DESCRIFTION (956) 689-2452 (958) 350-5600 (B0D) 464-2749 (979) 567-6116 (817) 410-7541
ADDRESS TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
A CARS PATROL PERSUIT 4 ea (Const 2:1-3:2 - 5:1) $102,576.00 $91,996.00 *1 $92,793.12 *1 $103,900.00 —»  $93,136.00
B. PICK-UP TRUCK CREW CAB Compac! 1 ea (Inspaction) NO BID $20,735.00 2 $22,285.56 2 |——* $22,920.00 NO BID
C. PICK-UP TRUGK 1/2 fon 4 X 4 CREW CAB 1 ga (Comm P4) $33,800.00 — > $29,236.00 $29,871.56 $29,446.00 $29,806.00 $31,213.00 ALT
D, PICK-UP TRUCKS 3/4 ton 4 X 4 CREW CAB 2 ea (Envire H) $64,970.00 —> $59,688.,00 $60.488.24 $61.350.00 $61,030.00
E. VAN 15 PASSENGER 1 ea (Juvenile) NO BID $29,582.00 *3 $30,136.56 —> $28,929.00 NO BID
A, DELIVERY / DAYS 120 120 120 120 80
B. DELIVERY ! DAYS N/A 90 120 120 N/A
C. DELIVERY / DAYS 105 90 120 90 90
D: DELIVERY / DAYS 90 90 120 90 100
E. DELIVERY / DAYS N/A 120 120 120 N/A

RECOMMENDATION g,

*{-NOT TO SPEC ENGINESIZE & DRIVE FW
*2 «NOT TO SPEC TRUGK SIZE & CAMERA BU

"3 . NOT TO SPEC ENGINE SIZE

| HEWRTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:
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