## **TABULATION**

ANNUAL BIDS - ROAD MATERIALS: CONCRETE # 2510 AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON DECEMBER 8, 2015, AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM: FEBRUARY 19, 2016 TO: FEBRUARY 18, 2017 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

MAGIC VAI	LLEY CONCRETE - CAPA
i	V. PALMA VISTA DR.
	MVIEW, TX. 78572
······································	
(956) 432-0600	
Pili	ce per/ cubic yard
<b>—</b>	\$106.00
	\$106.00
··	\$106.00
	\$106.00
	\$106.00
	\$100.00
	\$100.00
	\$100.00
	\$100.00
	\$100.00
	\$100.00
	\$114.00
	\$114.00
	\$114.00
	\$114.00
	\$114.00
	NO BID
	CIG ON
	NO BID
1	NO BID
	NO BID
+	NO BID
	NO BID
	HO WID
	\$83.00
	\$83.00
	\$83.00
	\$83.00
+	
	\$83.00
	3609 V PAL  pri

Demurrage 1 + hrs
RECOMMENDATION

THEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE	THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED.

CARLOS SANCHEZ COUNTY ENGINEER DEPT DATE	RUBEN GONZALEZ PUBLIC WORKS	DATE
MICHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE		