TABULATION

ANNUAL BID # 2430 - MOSQUITO INSECTICIDE
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: JANUARY 30, 2018 AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM: MARCH 16, 2018 TO: MARCH 15, 2019 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

VENDOR'S NAME CLARKE MOSQUITO UNIVAR USA TARGET SPECIALTY ADAPCO
& 675 SIDWELL CT., 402 McBRIDE LN., 1225 N. POST OAK RD,, 550 AERO LANE,
ADDRESS ST. CHARLES, IL. 60174 CORPUS CHRISTI, TX. 78408 HOUSTON, TX. 77055 SANFORD, FL. 32771
DESCRIPTION (800) 323-5727 (361) 945-2161 (800) 901-9746 (407) 328-6519

PR/GAL PRI/IGAL PR/GAL PRI/GAL

1. 18% resmethrin, 54% Piperonyl Butoxide - 5 pal/pail NO BID NO BID NO BID —  $519.14

2. 4% Resmethrin, 12% Piperony! Butoxide - (Ready to use = RTU) 55 gal/drum NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3, Oil - base Permethrin RTU, min 4% Permethrin, 8% Piperonyl Butoxide - (55 gal Drum) NO BID — $14.86 NO BID 33.66
4, Qil-based pyrethroids - min, 1.5% Oil-based Permethrin, 7.5% Piperonyl Butoxide - Ready to use (55 gal Drum) $43.63 — 14,86 NO BID 50.6
5. Qil-based Permethrin RTU, min. 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperonyl Butoxide - - Ready to Use (55 gal) Drum $18.00 — $14.86 $16.95 $15.94
6. Oil-based Permethrin RTU, min. 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperonyl Butoxide - ReadytoUse - 2X 2.5 gal/pall $18.00 —_ $14.86 $23.10 $16.07
7. Oil-based Permethrin RTU, min. 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperonyl Butoxide - Ready to Use - ( 275 gals) Mini Bulk $18.00 $14.86 $15.45 — $1455
8. Oil-based Permethrin Concentrate, min. 30% Permethrin, 30% Piperonly Butoxide - 5 gal/pail $55.38 —_— $55,24 $60.64 $94.00

9. Oil-based Permethrin Concentrate min. 31% Permethrin, 66% Piperonyl Butoxide - per/gal —  $98.00 NO BID $100.74 $125.00

10. Chlorpyrifos 1.5 Ib/gal RTU - 55 gal drum $38.00 NO BID NO BID —*  $46.50

11, Chlorpyrifos 1.5 Ib/gal RTU - 2.5 gal drum NO BID NO BID NO BID —*  $47.50

12. Altosid Briquets (220 cnt.) — 150 days (Open Market Price Increases allowed) $734.80 — $734.80 $734.80 $734.,80

13. Altosid Briquets (400 cnt.)—30days  (Open Market Price Increases allowed) $464.00 — $464.00 $464.00 $464.00

14. Bactimos Briquets (100 pr/box) - 30 days —* $71.00 NO BID $83.80 $79.82

15. Briquets - 6% Bacilus Sphaericus, 1% Bacillus thuringiensis (200 cnt) - 45 day NO BID NO BID NO BID — $256.35
16. EPA Approved Diluent Oil for Mosquito Control - 55 gal/drum $8.00 — $6.09 $6.85 $6.75

*1 - Local Vendor
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