TABULATION

PICK-UP TRUCKS (QTY. 9 + 2) SUV's (QTY. 3) CAR (QTY. 1) VAN (QTY. 1) - BID # 180102
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JANUARY 24, 2018 AT 11:00 A.M.

BIDDER'S NAME BOSWELL ELLIFF FORD | "BOGGUS FORD GRAPEVINEDCJ |  SILSHEE FORD
AND 1401 W. BUS HWY. 77, 2521 SOUTH EXPR. 83, 2601 WILLIAM TATE, 1211 U.S. HWY,, 96 N.
ADDRESS SAN BENITQ, TX. 78586 HARLINGEN, TX. 78550 GRAPEVINE, TX. 76051 |  SILSBEE, TX. 77656
DESGRIPTION (956) 399-2468 (956) 423-2580 N (817} 410-7541 (408) 860-9191
Qry TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE ALT  TOTAL PRICE ALT TOTAL PRICE

A GAR (Counly Skl 1 | ——  $16.750.00 §17.245.83 NO BID $17,179.08
§ SUV's MID SIZE (Cobny Cintk, Tax Hralgo) 3 | —= §77,056.00 §77.375.88 $74,259.00 *3 §76,024.24
C PICK UP CONPAGT CREW (Eng Impection) 1 NO BID NO BID NOBID | — 2531560
0 PIGKAUP TRUGK sEnven Maaling ) $29,501.00 $27,999.91 $27.282,00 L $28,170.15 ]
£ PICK-UP TRUGKS (Parkal] (B trsp) ( Brhy Vs 4 $120,460,00 | $11D,869.56 114632 $11243200 118632 311848284
FPICHKUP TRUCK [Emsig Mavt) 1 NOBID —  $48.294 17 $53,199.00 NO BID
& CARGO VAN [B'ag Mair) A1 NO BID —  $28,771.55 NO BID $28.820.16

| | owbid Io spec
H PICK-UP TRUCKS (Gt P2 & PajiPa Rangerszy | 4 | —*  §143,832.00 3 $144327.72 |  $112,432.00 1 $140,932.64
A DELIVERY / DAYS _ e [ 90 o 1 120
|8 DELVERY / DAYS [1easnsesk 2ea 760 | 80 | 120 | i 120
G DELIVERY / DAYS | na [ ~onma na - 120
|01 ) IVERY 7 DAYS o | | 8% _ . 90 100 1 120
£ DELIVER'Y / DAYS ) | - " || % 0w R
|- DELWERY / DAYS B : na . | 90 165 I P na_
G DELIVERY / DAYS na ) 90 na 120
HUELIVERY [ DAYS | 20 . 90 120 180
RECOMMENDATION - ' T
*1 - not to spec (see attached) ‘
*2 . L OW LOCAL WITHIN 3% of low bid to spec.
*3 - del concarns (see attached)
| HERE! ERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:

) (/)8 /~23/8

MICHAEL'FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE PG, 1 O ! FLEET MAINTENANCE

AWARDED BY COMMISSIONER'S COURT 02/06/2018




TABULATION

PICK-UP TRUCKS (QTY. 9 + 2) SUV's (QTY. 3) CAR (QTY. 1) VAN (QTY, 1) - BID # 180102
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON UANUARY 24, 2018 AT 11:00 AM.

j BIDCER'S NAME CALDWELL COUNTRY FORD CALODWELL COUNTRY CHEV
AND | PO BOX 27, PO BOX 27, A
ADDRESS CALDWELL, TX. 77836 CALDWELL, TX, 77836
DESCRIPTION (254) 773-8824 (B879) 567-6116
arty TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
|A_CAR [Caunty Clens) 1 $18.025.00 $18.414.00
£ SUV's MID BIZE (Coudy Clerk Tau, Brigge) 3 £79.272.00 -y | $75.840.00 "4
€ PICK UP COMPAGT GREW (Eng hepecton) 1 NO BID __$25.580.00
0 PICK-UP TRUCK (Enviro Health) 1.4 $28560.00 | T $26.840.00
£ PICK-UR TRUCKS (Patks?} (Eng_insp) ( Bidg Mact | 4 | $122.112.00 —  $111.520.00
[F PCK UP YRUCK [Fmorg Morm) 1 $48.883.28 ! $49,820.00
[GCARGO VAN (Bifg Maali 1 $29.433.00 | NOBD
14 PICK-UP TRUCKS (Corsl P2 8 P3) (Park f Rm;mz; 4 $146.404 00 1 . §123,08000 ‘1

A DELIVERY / DAYS | B ¥ %o |
lg pELvERY F0AYS ) - | . 120 1 120 |
© DELIVERY /DAYS | na s = = .
|0 DELIVERY /DAYS N A A T I S SEe——
EDELIVERY (DAYS i pia 126 - 120 |
FDEUVERY/DAYS | 150 150 !
DELWERY/DAYS | 120 na | .
r;o_zuvewflbms [™ 1 120 120
RECOMMENDATION—=
*{ - not to spec (see attached)
*4 - dolivery Eoncems (see attached) & LOW LOGAL WITHIN 3%
| HE ERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED: )
) L[26)l6 [ 29—/5
MICHAEL FORBESI PURCHASBING AGENT DA‘TE FG. 2 LE Ng»{ FLEET MAINTENANCE

AWARDED BY COMMISSIONER'S COURT 02/06/2018



