ANNUAL BIDS # 2680 - VOTING SUPPLIES

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON AUGUST 18, 2016 AT 11:00 A.M.
AWARD FROM : AWARD DATE TO: SEPTEMBER 30, 2017 W/ OPTICN TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - EACH RENEWAL ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR.

TABULATION

j —
recommendation Eleclons Admininstrator

RBM CONSULTING ELECTIONS SYSTEMS & SOFTWARE
12615 DEER HOLLOW DRIVE, 11208 JOHN GALT BLVD.,
OMAHA, NE. 68154 OMAHA, NE. 68137
(402) 212-0854 (800) 247-8683
DESCRIPTION u/m UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
A-1, ELECTION DAY VOTING KITS 102/TOTAL NO BID NO BID $28.06 $2,862.12
NO BID f— $2,862.12
A-TOTAL
B-1. EARLY VOTING, ELECTION DAY BALLOTS | 50,000 1s /50,000 2s|.229 1s/.229 25 $22,500.00 | .28 1s/.31 2s $28,500.00
B-2. TEST BALLOTS 100/TOTAL $0.229 $22.90 $0.31 $31.00
B-3. SAMPLE BALLOTS 500/TOTAL $0.229 $114.50 $0.31 $155.00
B4. FORMATTING - GENERAL BALLCT LAYOUT 100/TOTAL $0.00 $0,00 $30.00 $3,000.00
B-5. PRECINCT CHANGE BALLOT STYLES 50/TOTAL $0.00 $0.00 $13.15 $657.50
B. TOTAL $23,037.40 $33,343.50
C. BALLOT BY MAIL KITS { for both) 4500/TOTAL NO BID NO BID $1.20 —* $5,400.00
RECOMMENDATION —_—
A
| HERERY THE ABQVE TO BETH= O T BIDS RECEIVED:
- G2/ re

MICHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE REMI GARZA, ELECTIONS ADMINISTRATOR — DATE

ITEM A - MISC. (Successful Bidder on Section A-1 will also be utilized for purchase of the following items.
Please price based upon the following estimated quantities :

Commissioner's Court awarded categories A & C 10/04/2016 to ESS



