TABULATION

ANNUAL, BID #2660 - UNIFORMS: SHERIFF'S 7 JAILER/ INMATES,
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON NOVEMBER 10, 2015 AT 11:00 AM _
FROM: JANUARY 1, 2016 TO: DECEMEER 31, 2016 W/ OPTION TC RENEW ONCE OR TWICE ONE {1} ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL.

BIDDER'S NAME GALLS UNFIRMS MANUFACTURING, INC, BOBBARKER €0, UGS
AND YEARLY . 1340 RUSSELL CAVE RD,, P.0. BOX 12718, 134 N. AN ST, PO, BOX 21086,
ADDRESS APPROX LEXINGTON, KY. 40505 | SCOTTEDALE, AZ. 85267 FUQUAY VARIN,N.C. 2752¢ WACQ, TX. 76702
DESCRIPTION Qry. {800)876-4242. (480 368.9316 ; {800)354-9886 ) __ {BD0Y 6246427
UNIT PRICE TOTALPRIGE | UNIY PRIGE TOTAL PRICE]  UNIT PRIGE ) TOTALPRICE UNI.TPﬁIG'E o TOTAL PAIGE
A, PATROL UNIFORMS L ‘ ) -
A-1. Shirts - Short Sleevs - M 20 | $44.00 ] £9,240.00 NG BID NO'BID NO BID MO BIO NO BID. NO'BID
A2, Shiris - Long Sleeve - M 20 $48:00 $6,650.00 NO.BID NOBID NO BiD NG 81D NOEID NOBID
A-3. Panis - M 210 $41.00 $0.610:00 NG BID NO BID NQ-BID NOJID NORID NOBID
A-4. Shirts - Short Sleave - £ 60 ‘844.00 _ B2Ba000 T NOBID NCGBID NO By NG 810 NOBID . NOBID
A6, Shirls - Long Sleeve - £ & $46.00 $2,78000 | NOBID NCGBID NOBID NG 8D NOBID HOBID
A6, Pants - F 60 $41.00 . 3248000 |  NOBID ) NOBID 1 NOBID NOBID NOSID ] NOBID
A, TOTAL ey §BBAYO00 | NOBID NoBiD | ) ' NQ BID-
B, JAL GUARDS : . . ) ) o ) T
B-1. Shirts - Short Sloave-MIF 330 $42.00 _$13:660.00 NO BiD: NO.BID $58.76 L msrarse | NOBID -NOBID
B-2, Shirls - Long Sleeve « MIF 50 $48.00 ~’$2,400,00 NO BID ) NOBID 1  $6200 §3,400.00 | NOHID NOBD '
8.3, Panls - M 60 532,00 $1,$20.00 NO D - NOBID. $33.00 $1,680.00 NO-BID NGS5
B.4. Panls - ) £0 -$82.00 ___$182000.1 NOBID . NOBID 1 $3300 i 8188000 | NOBID ) NOBID
B.. TOTAL . - w»-; se{non oo |- NOEBID - j $28,787:50 B NOBID
C. INMATE COVERALLS & ' ) ) ' ] ' o —
_ UNIEORMS - ] - )
C-1. Coveralls . . ! s - ) | ’
White, Dark- Bluie (§-%L) 70 NOBID NOBID §  $10.40. . O R783.0D)  $1144 | . 800,80 $1265 $8685.40
While, Dark Blua {2X) 5 NOBID NOBD: | $10.80 $54.50]  $11.44 j $67.20, $12.65 $63.28]
Orange, Green (5-XL) 800, NOBIDT NOBIY T gtodn $E.640.00)  $4144 38884001  $1285 $7,560,00
Granpe, Grean (2%} 100 NOBID. B NOBID $10,00. C$1.090.00]  St144 L B1A4400] . §1pB5 . $1,265.00
Rad, Sllver, Tan (S-XL} 15 NOLBID NOBIE | s16.40 . $183.50]  $11.44 ) i _si7ie0] T Tgless $169.15
Red, Silver, Tan (2X) A0 1 Rosm NO BID 090 o 310800 $1944 0 ] HIA0T $13e8 $126:60(
(-2, V-Neck Shids : ) ] . ) L. '
Qranga, Red, Gresn (5-2X) 10 NO BID NOBID $4.58 . $45.90] 8582 . $68.201 sEAD ) 35600
White, Blue, Siivar, Tan (S-2%) 150 NO.BID NG B8ID . §4.89 - $Bee.500 8682 ' “$843,00 8680 _ $BA0.00
C-3. Work Pants T ' ' ' . - o Co
Orange, Red, Green (523 10 NO BID NO BID $5.96° 62600 $6.40. $84.00{ s660 ‘ $58.00
White, Blue, Silvar, Tan (8-2X) 150 NO-BID NG BID $6.95 . $802,600  $5.40 o $080.00{: 8560 ) . $840.00
C. TOTAL NO-BID NOBID om0 3D A0 £11,075.20] - . $11,012.00
[, INMATE SANDALS SHR. | 2000 KO BB ~NOBID $2.40 ] $4.68000. $148 _ $2,860.00 $1.52 $3,040,00
E, PATROL JACKETS 20 $105.00°  ———p $2, 10000 ] NQBID  NOBID NO BID NO BID
MISC, DISCOUNT OFFLIST . ‘ 0% 15% L 4% 5% .

RECOMMENDATION —

! HFR)ZZ‘QCERT!FY THE ABOVE TO BE THE COJEC?’ {IDS RECEIVED.  RECOMMENDATION:

MICHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE SAVIER REYNA T BATE
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TABULATION

ANNUAL BID #2660 - UNIFORMS: SHERIFF'S / JAILER/ INMATES.
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON NOVEMBER 10, 2015 AT 11:00 AM _ _
FROM: JANUARY 1, 2016 TO: DECEMBER 31, 2018 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/-EACH RENEWAL.,

BIDBER'S NAME CHARM TEX
AND YEARLY. 1818 COREY (SLAND AVENUIE,
ADDRESS APPROX BRODKEYN, NY 11230
DESCRIPTION QY. : (748).252-8100
N _UNIT ERice TOTAL PRIGE]
A. PATROL UNIFORMS : '
A1, Shire- Short Sleeve -M | 218 NO AID NOBID.
A2, Shina - Long Sleeve » M 20 NOBID . NO BID:
A3, Pantg - M 21 NOBID. NORID:
A-4, Shirts - Shor Sleeve - F &0 ©NOBID. - T NOBID
A5, Shirts - Long Sleave - F 80 NOBID, NOBID
A-B. Panis - F 80 CNOBID” NOBID
A, TOTAL RO BID NOBID |
B. JAIL QUARDS ) :
[3-1. Shirls - Shor Sleave-MIF 330 NOBID _ NOBID
B.2. Shirtg « Long Sleeve - MIF 50 NO BI0 NOBID
B-8. Pants - M €0 NQ-BID _ NOBID.
B-4. Panto «F 80 NG BID: NO 8ip
8. TQTAL NO BID ' NOBID:
C. INMATE COVERALLS & ' :
UNFORMS
1. Coveralls i R
Whita, Dark Blug (8-XL) 74 $1280 $903.00
Whita, Dark Blue (2X) [ 817,60 . . $64.50
{range, Grean {8-XLY 800 Br2.50. o $7:740.00
Qrange, Green (2X) 100 B1290. ]  $1.290.00
Red, Sitvar, Tan (S-XL) 18 $12.00° 316060
Red, Sliver, Tan (2X) 10 $12.00 s $120.60
C-2. V-Neck Shirts C
Qrange, Red, Oreen (8-2X) 10 $6.54 8640
While, Blue. Silver, Tan (3-2X) 140 $5.84 $831,00
C-3. Work Pants ) .
Orange, Red, Graen {S-2X) 10 9 $8.00 $50.001.
While, Blus, Slivar, Tan (S-2X) 150 $5.60 $EEE00]
C.  TOYAL $12,180.40
0. INMATE SANDALS SHR. 2000 §1.32 e 52 BAOO0
, PATROL JAGKETS 20 _ ] NG Bib
MISC. DIBCOUNT OFF LIST ' T ' 3%

RECOMMENDATION —  —

ms,com_nﬁtanmm s

| HERE?YU{#TIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORJC 69108 RECEIVED.  RECOMMENDATION:
q T ry

MICHASEFORBES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE JAVIER REYNA DATE NIKE LENARTY T e
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