ANNUAL BID #2660 - UNIFORMS: SHERIF
AS PER BIDS REGEIVED ON OCTOBER 31, 2017
FROM: JANUARY 1, 2018 TO: DECEMBER 31, 20

F'S / JAILER/ INMATES.
AT 11:00 AM

TABULATION

48 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE ONE (1) AD

DITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL.

[T BIDDER'S NANME BALLS UNFRVE MANUFACTURING NG | ROBBARKER CO ol “UEHARM TEX
AND YEARLY 1940 RUSSELL CAVE RO, P 0. BOX 12718, 134 N MAIN 8T, 1818 CONEY ISLAND AVENUE,
 ADURESS _ APPROX._ LEXINGTON, KY 40505 SCOTTSDALE, AZ 85267 FUQUAY VARIN, N.C. 27526 BROOKLYN, NY 11230
DESCRIPTION | QTY: . (gony pve-4242 | _|489) 3689315 (600} 840880 (r1By 2828100
et PRise B yoTaLpies | UNTEMCE T roTaLrmGE| LT PRIGE i N e Tptenrnes |
& PATROL UNIFORMS A - ] — . —
At Shists - Shot Sleave-M 210 §i4.90 §0,424.80 NO BID NO BID ND QD NG BID o NO Hib
A, Shirs - Long Sleeve - M 210 $4892 59,053 20 NO BID O BID HO BID NOBID | NOBID ___NOBID
A3, Pants - M 210 241,02 95,762 20 NO BID NO BID NopiD . nOo@iD NO BID NO BID
/v, Shirts - Short Sleava - F &0 §44.08 5269280 | NOBID NOBID | NOBID NOBID_ | NOBID NOBID
A5, Shiits « Lonp Sleave - F 60 §46.92 . saB16z0 | NOBID NO 810 NO BID i N BID NoBID NOBID
A6, Pants - F 60 54182 §2.809.00 MG BID NO BID NO BID NOBD | NOBID . ~ Nogio
A __TOTAL . > $38,077.40 NO BiD NO BID NO BID
0 JAIL GUARDS - o
B-1_Shins . Short Slwuve-WF 130 54284 14,137 20 Ho BID. NO BID NO BID _ROBID NOQ 810 o B
B2 Shirts + Lorg Sfeave - MF 50 SAn.O8 5240020 | NOBID NO BID HO BID NO BID NO BIO HO BID
B-3 Panls - M 80 42 64l 51,060 40 NO BID KO BID “NO B NG BID ND BID 16 81D
.4, Panis - F B0 532,84 — 5195840 | NOBIO ND BID O A0 NO BID NGB ~ NoBD
~ B, TOTAL . = N wodie | NOBID | ~ NOBID
G INMATE COVERALLSS 1 o = _— g N
_UNIFORMS e e — I =
G covents L | B R S ~ .
T Wle, Dark Blua tS-XL) |70 NG 8i0 THNOBID | 81790 —ST7000| 81081 730,801 512,90 $60a .0
| Wite, Dark Bluo () 6 HOSIRT  _ ____ _MOBID 5130 T §arsn|  3idAd T esvgol 81200 ]
Diange Groen (k) | 890 | NOBIO __Noap 51100 F6,600.08] 81057 = ““Epasz00] __ $12.00 TN
Orange. Green (2%) 100 fO 81D ND BID §14 50 R T T g1 04400l 51290 125080
Fed Siver, Tan (S-4L) 5 NO BID NO BID $11.00 51600  $10.57 $168.65 §12.90 $103 50
Red, Silver, Tan (2%} 10 NG Bib NG BID §11.50 11500  S11.44 “Siveag] _Siaee 892400
C-a. V-Nuck Shirts i - : i )
" Otangs, Rad, Groen (8-2X) 10 NO BIG: CE] 5446 SAN.GD| 84,40 552,60 55,72 TR
Vinlle, plue, Sliver, Tan (5:2X) 150 | NOBID NG BID $4.49 3673.50]  $5.26 5789.00 5572 658,03
A0, Wark Fants S T i e
= Grangs, 160, Groan (62X 10 NG BID NO DID 5548 55500 €448 __550.80] L R 1
Uitdte, Blip, Siver, Tan (5-2X), 150 NO BID NO BID 643 3814 60| 3380 882 10 5.90 505,00
T g, TOTAL NO BID NOBIO | ) 5048470 = $10.300.45 . Sii70)
£ TMMATE SANDALS SHK 2000 | nNoBD NO BID NOBID NOBID | §148 00000 Sio6 v §2.700 &
£ PATROL JACKETS 20 do7  ———  s#14ze0 | NO BID Ho B NO BID T NosiD
NISC. DISCOUNT OFF LIST == 10% 20% 5% IR .
RECOMMENDATION e
Y REaE
-~
I HER CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE cc?n E T7B$DS RECEIVED.,  RECOMYENDAJIO
» (15/1
MIiC FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE JAVIER REYNA ‘: DATE
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TABULATION

ANNUAL BID #2660 - UNIFORMS: SHERIFF'S / JAILER/! INMATES,

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON OCTORER 34, 2017 AT 11:00 AM
FROM: JANUARY 1, 2018 TO: DECEMBER 21, 2018 Wi OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWIGE ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL.,

DIODERS NAME | [GH3
AND YEARLY P.0. BOX 21086,
ADDRESS | APPROX | WACO, TX, 78702
DESCRIPTION ary.  (800) 524:5427
UHIT PUCE TOTAL PRICE
A PATROL UNIFORMS . . |
A-1. Shirts - Short Steave - M 210 NOBID MO BID
A-2. Shirla - Lonp Slesve - M 210 NOBID NO BID
A-3, Pants - M 210 NO BI0 ___ hosib
A, Bhins - Short Slaeve - £ 80 NO BID NOBID
f<5._Shirts « Long Slaeve - F 50 NO BID = NO BID
A0, Pents - F 80 NO BID NO 61D
— A, TOTAL HOBID "~ HOBID
1B, JAIL GUARDS B
{81, Shirs - Shodt SleovedyF | 330 NQ BID NOEID |
i5:2 Shirts - Lang Slaeve - WIE 50 HQ 81D NOBID |
B3 Pants-M 60 | _MNGBEID NOBID
B4, Ponis - F 80 NO BID NO BID
6. TOTAL ~No@lD NOEID
G, INMATE COVERALLS & ”
T 1 — i BT
(-1, Goverals — -
Whyte. Datk Blug (5-XL] 70 514,00 $568.10
Whita, Dark BEie [2X) 5 %132 83 £00.15
Omanga, (roan (S:AL) 600 §13:83 B $0,200.00
~ Orango, Gruan (2X) 100 $1a.83 ____S1,303.00
Red, Siver, Tan (S-%L) 18 §13,83 $207.45
 Red, Siver. Tan {2X) 10 §13.83 §130.30
C.2. V-Meck Shis
" Orange, Red, Green (5-2X) 10 $6.32 30320
Whita, Blua, Siivar, Tan (5:2%) 160 $6.52 $046.00
¢-2. Work Panls
Orange, Red, Greon (5:2%) 10 5381 i $58.10
Wie, Blug, Sliver, Tan (S-2X) 160 5501 $871.50
C.  TOTAL - $13,004.80
D. INVATE SANDALS SHR. 2000 51,65 - 53,100.00
. PATROL JACKETS 20 NO BID__ |
[MISC. DISCOUNT OFF LIST I

RECOMMENDATION et

| HERFAD CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE GOR{R?C'I?BI‘?S RECEIVED. T
[N o
MIKE LIENART OATL

—
TCHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE '
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