



TABULATION

ANNUAL BIDS - ROAD MATERIALS: CONCRETE # 2610
 AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON DECEMBER 6, 2016, AT 11:00 A.M.
 FROM: FEBRUARY 10, 2017 TO: FEBRUARY 10, 2018 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.
 OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

BIDDER'S NAME AND ADDRESS	MAGIC VALLEY CONCRETE LLC CAPA 3609 W. PALMA VISTA DR., PALMVIEW, TX. 78672 (956) 432-0600	
DESCRIPTION	price per/ cubic yard	
1. A. Class A Concrete - 3000 P.S.I. Min.		
1. Zone 1	→	\$120.00
2. Zone 2	→	\$120.00
3. Zone 3	→	\$120.00
4. Zone 4	→	\$120.00
5. Zone 5	→	\$120.00
B. Class B Concrete - 2000 P.S.I. Min.		
1. Zone 1	→	\$116.00
2. Zone 2	→	\$116.00
3. Zone 3	→	\$116.00
4. Zone 4	→	\$116.00
5. Zone 5	→	\$116.00
C. Class C Concrete - 3600 P.S.I. Min.		
1. Zone 1	→	\$132.00
2. Zone 2	→	\$132.00
3. Zone 3	→	\$132.00
4. Zone 4	→	\$132.00
5. Zone 5	→	\$132.00
D. Class D Concrete - 1500 P.S.I. Min.		
1. Zone 1		NO BID
2. Zone 2		NO BID
3. Zone 3		NO BID
4. Zone 4		NO BID
5. Zone 5		NO BID
E. Fibers for Concrete - Synthetic 3600 P.S.I. Min.		
1. Zone 1	→	\$7.00
2. Zone 2	→	\$7.00
3. Zone 3	→	\$7.00
4. Zone 4	→	\$7.00
5. Zone 5	→	\$7.00
Fiber is closed/sold by LB/CY. This price applies only to 1 LB/CY. Additional Fiber priced accordingly		
2. A. Cement Treatment (Road Mixed)		
1. Zone 1		NO BID
2. Zone 2		NO BID
3. Zone 3		NO BID
4. Zone 4		NO BID
5. Zone 5		NO BID
3. A. Cement Flowable Backfill 80-150 P.S.I.		
1. Zone 1	→	\$95.00
2. Zone 2	→	\$95.00
3. Zone 3	→	\$95.00
4. Zone 4	→	\$95.00
5. Zone 5	→	\$95.00

Demurrage over 2 + hrs @ \$60 pr/hr
 Truck ordered & not used will be charged at par load ticket= full value of load.
 RECOMMENDATION →

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED.

 MICHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT 12/27/16 DATE


 PAOLINA VEGA, COUNTY ENGINEER DATE
 RUBEN GONZALEZ PUBLIC WORKS DATE

Awarded by Commissioner's Court 12/22/2016