

TABULATION

ANNUAL BIDS # 2280-1 - FUEL (UNLEADED / DIESEL)

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JUNE 19, 2018 AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM: OCTOBER 1, 2018 TO: SEPTEMBER 30, 2019 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - EACH RENEWAL ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR.

PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED BASED ON O.P.I.S. INCREASES ONLY.

VENDOR'S NAME & ADDRESS		VALERO MKT & SUPPLY P.O. BOX 69600, SAN ANTONIO, TX. 78269 (210) 345-2000		OIL PATCH 1905 BAYOU COURT, BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78526 (956)831-4839	
DESCRIPTION					
OPTION 1 - OPIS + PRICING					
COUNTY SITES		COMMISSION AFTER (OPUS+TAX+FREIGHT)		COMMISSION AFTER (OPUS+TAX+FREIGHT)	
A.	UN LEADED 89 OCT. - ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID		NO BID	
B.	DIESEL - ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID		→ (Commission - 0.00) (State Freight charge - .0895)	
CONVENIENT STORE SITES					
A.	UN LEADED 89 OCT. - ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID		NO BID	
B.	DIESEL - ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID		NO BID	
				DELIVERY FEE UNDER 2499 GAL. DIESEL = \$3.75 over 2499 GAL. \$10.00	
OPTION 2 - RETAIL - MINUS PRICING					
COUNTY SITES		DISCOUNT OFF RETAIL PRICE		DISCOUNT OFF RETAIL PRICE	
A.	UN LEADED 89 OCT. - ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID		NO BID	
B.	DIESEL - ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID		NO BID	
CONVENIENT STORE SITES					
A.	UN LEADED 89 OCT. - ALL LOCATIONS	→ 0.08		N/A	
B.	DIESEL - ALL LOCATIONS	→ 0.08		N/A	
				DELIVERY FEE UNDER 2500 GAL. DIESEL = \$1.70 X over 2500 TO 4999 GAL. \$5	
				DELIVERY FEE 5,000 GAL. TO 8,000 GAL. \$5.45	
				IF PAID WITHIN 10 DAYS: ADDITIONAL .0395 DISCOUNT	

PRICE PR/GALLON - WILL INCLUDE FREIGHT

DELIVERED FUEL PRICES WILL INCLUDE STATE TAX, UNDERGROUND FEE & COMMISSIONS, BUT NO SUPER FUND FEE

RECOMMENDATION →

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:

MICHAEL FORBES, ASST. AUDITOR / PURCHASING DATE 8/20/18

JOSE DE LA O AUDITORS DEPT. DATE

Awarded by Commissioner's Court 9/4/2018

TABULATION

ANNUAL BIDS # 2280-1 - FUEL (UNLEADED / DIESEL)

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JUNE 19, 2018 AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM: OCTOBER 1, 2018 TO: SEPTEMBER 30, 2019 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - EACH RENEWAL ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR.

PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED BASED ON O.P.I.S. INCREASES ONLY.

VENDOR'S NAME & ADDRESS		GOLD STAR PETROLEUM 851 E. FRONTAGE US 83, SAN JUAN, TX. (281) 379-6928	WEX BANK 7090 SOUTH UNION PARK CENTER, S# 350 MIDVALE, UT 84047 (888) 842-0075
DESCRIPTION			
OPTION 1 - OPIS + PRICING			
COUNTY SITES		COMMISSION AFTER (OPUS+TAX+FREIGHT)	COMMISSION AFTER (OPUS+TAX+FREIGHT)
A.	UN LEADED 89 OCT.- ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID	NO BID
B.	DIESEL - ALL LOCATIONS	(Commission - 0.0498) (State Freight Charge - .3750)	NO BID
CONVENIENT STORE SITES			
A.	UN LEADED 89 OCT.- ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID	NO BID
B.	DIESEL - ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID	NO BID
OPTION 2 - RETAIL - MINUS PRICING			
COUNTY SITES		DISCOUNT OFF RETAIL PRICE	DISCOUNT OFF RETAIL PRICE
A.	UN LEADED 89 OCT.- ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID	NO BID
B.	DIESEL - ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID	NO BID
CONVENIENT STORE SITES			
A.	UN LEADED 89 OCT.- ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID	0.06
B.	DIESEL - ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID	0.06

PRICE PR/GALLON - WILL INCLUDE FREIGHT

DELIVERED FUEL PRICES WILL INCLUDE STATE TAX, UNDERGROUND FEE & COMMISSIONS, BUT NO SUPER FUND FEE.

RECOMMENDATION →

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:

 8/20/18
MICHAEL FORBES, ASST. AUDITOR / PURCHASING DATE


JOSE DE LA O AUDITORS DEPT. DATE
PG 2

Awarded by Commissioner's Court 9/11/2018

TABULATION

ANNUAL BIDS # 2280-1 - FUEL (UNLEADED / DIESEL)

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JUNE 19, 2018 AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM: OCTOBER 1, 2018 TO: SEPTEMBER 30, 2019 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - EACH RENEWAL ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR.

PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED BASED ON O.P.I.S. INCREASES ONLY.


VENDOR'S NAME & ADDRESS		ARGUINDEGUI OIL 6551 STAR CT., LAREDO, TX 78041 (956) 722-5251	BOYCOTT PETROLEUM 601 McHENRY AVE., MODESTO, CAL 95350 (209) 606-2395
DESCRIPTION			
OPTION 1 - OPIS + PRICING			
COUNTY SITES		COMMISSION AFTER (OPUB.+TAX.+FREIGHT)	COMMISSION AFTER (OPUB.+TAX.+FREIGHT)
A.	UN LEADED 89 OCT.- ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID	NO BID
B.	DIESEL - ALL LOCATIONS	(Commission - 0.2790) (State Freight Charge - .0)	NO BID
CONVENIENT STORE SITES			
A.	UN LEADED 89 OCT.- ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID	NO BID
B.	DIESEL - ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID	NO BID
OPTION 2 - RETAIL - MINUS PRICING			
COUNTY SITES		DISCOUNT OFF RETAIL PRICE	DISCOUNT OFF RETAIL PRICE
A.	UN LEADED 89 OCT.- ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID	NO BID
B.	DIESEL - ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID	NO BID
CONVENIENT STORE SITES			
A.	UN LEADED 89 OCT.- ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID	0.015
B.	DIESEL - ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID	0.015

PRICE PR/GALLON - WILL INCLUDE FREIGHT

DELIVERED FUEL PRICES WILL INCLUDE STATE TAX, UNDERGROUND FEE & COMMISSIONS, BUT NO SUPER FUND FEE.

RECOMMENDATION →

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:


MICHAEL FORBES, ASST. AUDITOR / PURCHASING DATE 8/20/18


JOSE DE LA O AUDITORS DEPT. DATE
PG 3

Awarded by Commissioner's Court 9/4/2018

TABULATION

**ANNUAL BIDS # 2280-1 - FUEL (UNLEADED / DIESEL)
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JUNE 19, 2018 AT 11:00 A.M.**

**FROM: OCTOBER 1, 2018 TO: SEPTEMBER 30, 2019 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - EACH RENEWAL ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR.
PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED BASED ON O.P.I.S. INCREASES ONLY.**

VENDOR'S NAME & ADDRESS		FLEETCOR TECHNOLOGIES 601 McHENRY AVE., MODESTO, CAL 95350 (209) 606-2395
DESCRIPTION		
OPTION 1 - OPIS + PRICING		
COUNTY SITES		COMMISSION AFTER COPUS, TAX, FREIGHT
A.	UN LEADED 89 OCT.- ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID
B.	DIESEL - ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID
CONVENIENT STORE SITES		
A.	UN LEADED 89 OCT.- ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID
B.	DIESEL - ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID
OPTION 2 - RETAIL - MINUS PRICING		
COUNTY SITES		DISCOUNT OFF RETAIL PRICE
A.	UN LEADED 89 OCT.- ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID
B.	DIESEL - ALL LOCATIONS	NO BID
CONVENIENT STORE SITES		
A.	UN LEADED 89 OCT.- ALL LOCATIONS	0.020
B.	DIESEL - ALL LOCATIONS	0.020

PRICE PR/GALLON - WILL INCLUDE FREIGHT

DEFI IVERED FUEL PRICES WILL INCLUDE STATE TAX, UNDERGROUND FEE & COMMISSIONS, BUT NO SUPER FUND FEE.

RECOMMENDATION →

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:

 MICHAEL FORBES, ASST. AUDITOR / PURCHASING DATE 8/20/18

 JOSE DE LA O AUDITORS DEPT. DATE 8/20/18
PS-4

Awarded by Commissioner's Court 9/4/2018