TABULATION
ANNUAL BIDS 82620 . yoap DRAINAGE MATERIALS

AS PER BIDg REGEIVED on beCEMBER 15,2015 AT 19:00 A,
FROM: MARCH 23, 2016 TO: MA

OPEN MARKET {CosT ONLY) PRICE INCREASRS AlLowep

VENGOR'S NAME CONTECH CONSTRUGTION RIC VALLEY FIPE TGAFA
ADDRESS 2201 WEST ROYAL LANE, g4 170, | 3809 W. PALMA VISTA bR,
DESCRIPTION IRVING, TX, 78083 PALMVIEW, TX, 78572
28502000 432.06800
A [CORRUGATED METAL PIPE, ASPHALT EOATES
DELIVERED 1O THE Jog SITE PRICE PER LF, PRICE PER L.F.
VRS P L CORRUGATIONS - 185 ~ 1520 _NOBIb
3 24X TR X TB RUGATIONS - 76 G — % 18.00 NOBID |
) X2 AN 12> CORRUGATIONS - 1a G — 7378 NOBIp.
4} XX 17 - CORRUBATIONS -7 & b A Y T % T RO BID
5) 48" XTI 173 ~CORRUGATIONS - 14 G — Y 5500 T NO Bip
8} 60" X3 IR K 17 - CORRUGATIONS » G — 9130 NQ BiDy
X EF X170 ORRUGATIONS . 12 6 —% g 124,30 ND BID
&) 84X T X CORRUGATIONS 13 & —k g 14410 NO BiD
8) 86X 3 X v CORRUGATIONS . 106~ N 166.10 0 BIb
10) ¥ BAND ¢OUBLER COMPLETE W/R OLTg PRICE PER EAGH PRICE FER EAGH
(AY 187 I — % 228 RO BID
B3 24 — ] 28,60 NO 8ID
€) 307 e E T I | NG Bn
(D) 367 = 61,05 NOBID
Ey 487 — g 82.50 NG 8I0
807 — g 162.60 NO BID
G 727 —F Ty 24860 i3 Big
84% — 3 28870 NG BID
1} 867 — % 33220 NO BID-
RECOMMENDATION E—n '3 - PREIGHT 3 90% 00 P71 Fi 18EQ LOAD
PROPOSALS RECEWVED
1
Kt
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TABULATION

ANNUAL BIDS #2520 - ROAD DRAINAGE MATERIALS

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON DECEMBER 18,2018 AT 11:00 AM,

FROM: MARCH 23, 2016 TO: MARCH 22, 2017 WIOPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL
OFEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRIGE INCREASES ALLOWED

VENDOR'S NAME CONTECH CONSTRUGTION RIO VALLEY PIPE - CAPA
ADDRESS 2201 WEST ROYAL LANE, S#170, | 2608 W, PALMA VISTA DR.,
DESCRIPTION IRVING, TX. 76063 PALMVIEW, TX. 78572
{872} 580-2000 {936) 432:0600
B | CONCRETE PIPE WITOINTING MATERIALS TO
REINFOROED T & G - GLASS I PRICE PER L.F. PRICE PER LF..
A) 18* X 8LF. NO BID —k 3 17,65
8) 24"} X BL.F, NO BID — & 22.95
C} 30"/ X BLF, NO BID — 3810
Dy 36°f X BL,F. NO BI0 —t 62,50
E) 427 X B LF, NOBIC — S 66.06
{F) 481 X 8L F. NGO 8ID ot § $9.50
{G) 587 XBLE. . § 105,10
C  |CONCRETE FIPE PRICE PERLF, PRICE PER LF,
REINFORCED GASKET (Flex Joint). GLASS (1t
A) 18X 8TE, NO BID — % 20.30
B) M4YXBLF. NOBID i § 26.80
C) 30 X 8L.F. NO BID —n 8 38.10
Dy 367X 8 1.F. NO BID — 8 6220
E} A2YXBLF. et & 65,05
F) 40 XaLF. NOBID — 80,80
G} 84X BLF, NO BID — 108,30
H) 60X 8LF, NO BlD — 136.80
Iy T2Y%X8LF, NO BID 4 18760

RECOMMENDATIGN ™+
| HERER RTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE GCORRECT PROPOSALS RECEIVED:

- [2[31/1s"
MICHAEL FORBES, FURCHASING AGENT TATE
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TABULATION

ANNUAL BIps #2520 « ROAD-DRAINAOE MATERIALS

AS PER BIDg RECEIVED o DECEMBER 16, 2016 AT 14:00 AM,

FROM: MAROH 3, 2014 1o MARCH 22, 2017 WIOPTION To RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FoR ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL
E INCREASES ALLowep

RIO VALLEY BipE - CAPA

3609 W. PALMA VISTA bR,

PALMVIEW, Tx. 78572
956) 43

CONTECH CONSTRUGTIGN
2201 wiEsT ROYAL LANE, sr 17,
IRVING, TX, 76063

972

2} 580-2000 20600
H _ RAIN INLEYS TYRE i PRICE PER EAGH
TO CONFORM WiaSTM C-478 \
| T A \No BiD
MG NOBID
] NG 8o =+ § 100480
[ ] NO BID m!@m-_
] NO BID =+ 5 126106
[ ] NG BID mm—
. NG BID m-m_
H CONCRETE pRray \
TO CONFORM' M PRIGE PER ERET
$__1,180.30
\m 8l

=

z

m
o3
~I
°3

g
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1.280.10
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TABULATION

ANNUAL BIDS #2520 - ROAD DRAINAGE MATERIALS

ASPER BI0S RECEIVED ON DECEMBER 16, 2015 AT 11:00 AM.

FROM: MARGH 23, 2016 TO: MARCH 22, 2017 WIOPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH BACH RENEWAL
OPEN MARKET [COST ONLY) PRICE INGREASES ALLOWED

VENDOR'S NAME CONTECH CONSTRUGTION RIOVALLEY PIFE - GAPA
ADDRESS 2201 WEST ROYAL LANE, S#170, | 3605 W. PALMA VISTA DR.,
DESCRIPTION IRVING, tX. 75063 PALMVIEW, TX, 78572
(872) 590-2000 (956) 4320600
F. JCONCRETE BOX CULVERTS PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH

TO CONFORM WIASTH C462 N
A EWXEHRE () NG SiE e §  2.001,28
B) &' (W) X 4 (H) X&' IE NOBID — & 2,424.56
C) 8 W XG (H XE (. : NO EID —t_ §  2666,16
D) 8 x4 (HXe( NOBID ——y & 2 A70.08
_B) 1000 X0 (ML X6 @) \ NO BID % § 406732
A I XTI R ) NO) BID s 384372
G) 107 (M) X6 ([ X & (L) NO BiD —y 351830
HY 4 W X3 X8I 8 161120

RECOMMENDATION  ———
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TABULATION

ANNUAL BIDS #2520 - ROAD DRAINAGE MATERIALS .

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON DEGEMBER 18, 2016 AT 11:00 A.M,

FROM: MARGH 23, 2016 TO: MARCH 22, 2017 WIOPTION TO RENEW ONGE OR TWICE FOR ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH BACH RENEWAL
OPEN MARKET {COST DNLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

VENDOR'S NAME CONTEGH CONBTRUGTION RIO VALLEY BiPE - CAPA
ADDRESS 2201 WEST ROYAL LANE, S# 170, | 3600 W. PALMA VISTADR.,
DESCRIPTION IRVING, TX. 75063 PALMVIEW, TX. 78572
(972} 690-2000 {8865) 4320600
G, |CONCRETE PIPE REINFORGED (T & G) GLAGS Il
A1 %8 LE. NG BID —+ § 12.40 PRIL.F.
8) 127X B L F. REINFORCED GASKET (FLEX JOINT] NO BiD —+ § 16.00 PRILF.
MISC OFF 0%

RECOMMENDATION  ——
{ HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT PROPOSALS RECENVED:

(L2 e foi fis”

MICHAEL "FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE |
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