TABULATION

PICK-UP TRUCKS (QTY.- 7), CARS (QTY. - 7), SUV's (QTY. 4 ) VAN (QTY.- 1) - VARIOUS DEPTS. - BID # 160104
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: FEBRUARY 9, 2016 AT 11:00 A.M,

VENDOR'S NAME SILSBEE FORD COWBOY CHEVORLET TIPTCN FORD
& 1211 U.S HWY. 96 N, 1415 HWY , 96 BYPASS, 3840 N. EXPRESSWAY,
ADDRESS SILSBEE, TX. 77658 SILSBEE, TX. 77656 BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78523
DESCRIPTION (409) 880-8191 {409) 895-3860 (956) 350-5600
DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
A VAN 15 PASSENGER (QTY. 1) Elections $32,726.36 - low bid NO BID $33,006.00 - low local bid within 3% of low
B. TRUCK 1 TON FLATBED (QTY. 1) Public Works NOBID NO BID $60,635.10
C. CAR (QTY. 1) Sheriff's $17,220.18 NO BID $18,257.00
D. PATROL CARS (QTY. 6) Const 2(1), 3(2). 4(2), 5(1), NO BID $155,722.00 $131,856.00 "1 not to spec
E. SUBURBAN {QTY. 1) Bridge NOBID -—» $39,154.00 $35,287.00 * 2 not to spec
F. SUV MID SIZE (QTY, 3) HR, Dist Clerk, County Clerk $76,725.00 NO BID $76,086.00 - low local bid within 3% of low
G. PICK UP TRUCK 3/4 TON (QTY. 1) Farm & Home $32,946.10 - low bid NQ BID $33,292.00 - low local bid within 3% of low
H. PICK UP TRUCKS 1/2 TON CREW CAB {QTY. 3} Sheriff, Bidg T T P '
Maint, Emerg Mgmt NQ BID $86,688.00 L $88464.00. - low local bid within 3% of low
1. PICK-UP TRUCK 1/2 TON (QTY. 1) Bridge NQ BID —  $22,769.00 $22,845.00 * 5 notto spec
J. PICK-UP TRUCK 1/2 TON 4X4 (QTY. 1} Planning & Inspection NO BID $26,342.00 $27,173.00
A. DELIVERY / DAYS 120 NO BID 120
B. DELIVERY / DAYS NO BID NO BID 150
C. DELIVERY / DAYS 120 NO BID 120
D. DELIVERY / DAYS NO BID 210 120
E DELIVERY /DAYS NOBID 120 120
F. DELIVERY /DAYS 120 NO BID 120
G. DELIVERY / DAYS 120 NO BID 120
H. DELIVERY / DAYS NO BID 120 120
i. DELIVERY / DAYS NO BID 120 120
J. DELIVERY / DAYS NO BID 120 120

RECOMMENDATION —»

" « low - not to spec engine size & wheel drive
*2 - low - not to spec engine size

*5 - low local within 3% - not to spec engine size

| HEREBY TIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED;
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MIKE FARBES / PURCHASING AGENT DATE !

Cat B - per Xavier Villarreal - reject & rebid / over budgst

Cat C - per Sheriff's Dept. - reject and not award - fund 90

Cat H - per Sheriffs Dept. - reject and not award - fund 30 (Sheriff's Dept. Vehicle anly) Award: Bidg & Emerg Mgmt Vehicles
Low local Dealer within 3% - Cat A, F, G, H, (Tipton Ford) Cat: D (Don Johnson)

L.ow non local wfo 3% factor- Cat E, I, J

LEE LOZANO [/ FLEET MAINT DEPT. DATE
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TABULATION

PICK-UP TRUCKS (QTY.- 7), CARS {(QTY. - 7), SUV's (QTY. 4) VAN (QTY.- 1) - VARIOUS DEPTS. - BID # 160104
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: FEBRUARY 9, 2016 AT 11:00 A.M.

VENDOR'S NAME GRAPEVINE DODGE CALDWELL COUNTRY BON JOHNSON
& 2601 WILLIAM TATE, P.0. BOX 27, 2010 CENTRAL BLVD.,
ADDRESS GRAPEVINE, TX. 76051 CALDWELL, TX. 77836 BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78520
DESCRIPTION (817) 410-7541 (979) 567-6116 (956) 546-2288
DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
A_VAN 15 PASSENGER (QTY. 1) Elections NO BID NO BID NO BID
B. TRUCK 1 TON FLATBED (QTY. 1) Public Works NO BID NO BID NO BID
C. CAR (QTY. 1) Sheriffs $20,189.00 $15.465.00 NO BID
D. PATROL CARS (QTY. 6) Const 2(1), 3(2), 4(2), 5(1), $153,444.00 - low bid $157,350.00 $156,088.62 - low local bid within 3% of Tow
E. SUBURBAN (QTY. 1) Bridge NO BID $39,590.00 NO BID
F_SUV MID SIZE (QTY. 3 HR, Dist Clerk, Gounty Clerk $88.,167.00 $73,0206,00 - low bid $66,860.38 "3 not to spec
G. PICK UP TRUCK 3/4 TON (QTY. 1) Farm & Home $36,279.00 $35,949.00 $27,341.58 *4 not to spec
H. PICK UP TRUCKS 1/2 TON CREW GAB (QTY, 3) Sheriff, Bldg
Maint, Emerg Mgmt $86,985.00 - low bid / $90,057.00 $87,840.00 $89,979.27
I. PICK-UP TRUCK 1/2 TON (QTY. 1} Bridge $25.444.00 $23,115.00 $25.441.63
J. PICK-UP TRUCK_1/2 TON 4X4 (QTY. 1) Plannirg & Inspection $28,067.00 —%$26,310.00 $28,438.86
A_DELIVERY / DAYS NO BID NO BID NO BID
B. DELIVERY / DAYS NO BID NO BID NO BID
C. DELIVERY / DAYS 90 20 NO BID
D. DELIVERY / DAYS 90 150 90
E. DELIVERY { DAYS NO BID 90 NO BID
F. DELIVERY / DAYS 90 90 90
G. DELIVERY / DAYS 100 120 90
H. DELIVERY / DAYS 100 to 150 120 90
. DELIVERY / DAYS a0 90 90
J. DELIVERY / DAYS 90 120 56

RECOMMENDATION —»
*3 - low - ot to spec - varioius
*4 - low - not to spec engine
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MIKE FORBES / PURCHASING AGENT DATE'

Cat B - per Xavier Villarreal - reject & rebid / over budget
Cat C - per Sheriff's Dept. - reject and not award - fund 90
Cat H - per Sheriff's Dept. - reject and not award - fund 90 (Sheriff's Dept. Vehicle only) Award: Bidg & Emerg Mamt Vehicles

Low non local wfo 3% factor - Cat E, |, J
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ERT [Y THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED: Low local Dealer within 3% - Cat: A, F, G, H, (Tipton Ford) Cat: D (Don Johnson)
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LEE LOZANO [/ FLEET MAINT DEPT. DATE
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