TABULATION

ANNUAL BID % 2580 « ROAD SURFACING HATERIALS
AB PER BIDY RECEIVED ON BECEMBER 46, 2016 AT 1400 AW

FROM: MARCH 16, 2018 TO MARCH 14, 2017 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL,,
CPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) FRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

BIDDER'S NAME IPPER VALLEY MATERIALS ANDERSON COLUMBIA [FRONTERA MATERIALS  VULGAN MATEIALS
AND ADDRESS 3800 W, PALMAVISTA, P.0. BOX 585, P.O.BOX 1448, | P.O. BOX 791650,
PALMVIEW, TX. 78672 | WESLACO,TX. 78509 | ELSA, TX. 78643  SANANTONIO, TX. 76279
- DESCRIFTION (956) 432-0800 {858) 6604814 {856} 318-8852 (210) 624-3587
A.| HOT RiiX-
ASPHALYIC CONCREYE PERITON PERTON PERITON . FERTON
| 11:Type "D - Gravel / Limestons
“Paving & Spoed Humps™ _ =5 —
{1) Zona1 38845 40 —— .
{2) Zong 2 35646 %7'!3‘.40 ——+ 88025 NO BID
(3) Zono 3 $88.45 £74:40 — 00 NOBID
(4 Zong 4 M Y13 $74.40 ~s 362 20 NOBID
(5) Zena 5 $68.45 $74.40 —+ $61.76 NOBIT
- for pick $68.95 $50.00 ——__$58.00 NOBID
J8.| LIMESTONE ROCK
ASPHALT (CLASS PERITON PERTON FERTON FERITON
1. Typo “CC™ - natural cold - coarsa e
{a) PubllcWorks Brownsvilo _$08.00 NO BiR NOBID — __$81.70
@mm%m $63.60 NOBID NOBID —v_$68.59
(¢} Public Works Haréingen _ $98.00 NO BID NO BID =~ _§87.79
() Zono 1 $98,00 NO BID NO BID —__$8850
(e} Zone? $68.00 NO BID NO BID — .39
. Zored ~$88.00 NOBID NO BID — .60
Zoned $05.60 NO BID NQ BID — _$83.39
(h) _Zono & £63.00 NO BID NOBID —+ 38460
2. YYPE "D” - natural cold - fines _ _—
_(a) Public Works Brownsvilla $98.00 ~+  $78.00 NQ BID _S84,70
{b)_Bubiio Works 8an Bentto $86.00 — _ $7800 NO BID $61.60_
{c} Bublic Works Harlingan $68.00 — %7800 :g g:g g:ng
(d)_Zona 1 $95.00 —+ __$80.00 08I !
{0) Zone2 $0B.01 — __$7860 NO BIO £9230
(h_Zons3 $98.01 e $78.40 NO BID $83.69
(0} Zone 4 £68.00 v §7840 NO BID 20630
L1 (h) Zone§ £$58.00 e 57020 . NO BID $97.99
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TABULATION

ANNUAL BID # 2360 - ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS

A8 PER BIDS RECEIVED ON DECEMBER {8, 2018 AT 11100 A

FROK: BARCH 16, 2018 TO MARCH 15, 2017 W/ OPYTION TO RENEW ONGE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDIVIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.
OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

BIDGERS NAME ER VALLEY MATERIALS ANDERSON COLUMBIA [FRONTERA MATERIALS “VULCAN MATERALS )
AND ADDRESS 3608 W, PALMAVISTA, P.O. BOX 585, PO.BOX 1448, | P.O, BOX 791680,
PALMVIEW, TX, 78672 | WESLACO, TX. 78688 |  ELSA,TX.78543  SANANTONIO, TX. 78279
DESCRIPTION (848) 4320800 (956} 860-4814 {956) 316-8962 (210) 524-3507
C.] AGGREGATE FOR SURFACE N
mmt’;g'g’m PARITON PERITON PERITON PERITON
1. Type P.E. Grade 3 -
{a) Zona { " $68.00 NO BID . 340.80 §74.69
Zono 2 $88.60 NG BID —e 35200 :;s.ga
{c) Zons s $56.00 NO BD ——_ $52.75 6.50
{d) Zon 4 £68,00 NOBID —+__$53.00 [ _§7039
o} Zo';o § $58.00 NOBID o 854,00 $30.60
2 Typo PE._Grade 4 NooCosied ”
@),z ] S 7 ORI Y NOED
(b} Zone 2 37,00 NO BiD e $30.28 NO BiD
{c) Zono 3 $37.00 NO BID e $30.75 NG BID
{d) Zoned $57.00 NG BID — 8§30 NO BID
(e) Zons § $37.00 NO BID e $31.60 NO BID
3. Typo PE, Gredo5
et e o —r—— =
Zono 2 $68.00 NO BID — 2.0 g
c) Zono 3 ﬁi.%o NO BID —  $52.75 878,
Zono 4 $88.00 NOBIO e~ $53.00 $81.30
{¢) Zonob §88.00 NOBID e §54.60 $0208
4. Typo P.E._Grado 8 HonOosted o
(@) Zong 1 NO Bl
{6) Zone2 NO BID
(c) Zona3 NO B
Zona 4 NG BID
{6) Zano§ NO BID
RECOMMENDATION BY COUNTY ENGINEER: ——v «
I H FY THE ABOVE TO BE THE BIDS RECEVED:
: 2/t fib
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‘TABULATION

ANNUAL BID & 2580 - ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS

AS PER BIDY RECEIVED ON DECEMBER 15, M8 AT 1:00 A,
FROM: MARCH 18, 2016 TOW“,E‘WWIOPTION?ORﬁNEWONGEDRMCEFDRONEHMDD{WALYEARW!THEACH RENEWAL.
OPENW(CWTONLY)PRIOENCREASEBW

BIDDER'S NAME [UPPER VALLEY MATERIALS ANDERBON COLUMBIA [FRONTERA MATERIALS  VULGAR MATERIALS
AND ADDRESS 3600 W, PALMAVISTA, P.0, BOX £85, P.O.BOX 1448, | P.0,BOX 781580,
PALMVIEW, TX. 78572 | WESLACO, TX.78660 |  ELSA,TX.78543  SANANTONIO, TX. 78278
DESCRIFTION (856) 432-0500 {658) 8804814 (e88)316-:6982 | (210) 6249687
p SECONDARY - BACK-UP SUPPLIER
A HOT Barx-
ASPHALYIC CONCRETE PERITON PERITON PERITON PERITON
1. Yype “D" - Gravel / Limestons
“Paviny & Speed Humps® — —
(1) Zone 1 —  $87.05 £76.40 $61.60 381.60
£2) Zons 2 — __ $67.85 $74.60 $02 55 $02 30
f8) Zone 3 —— 88705 T340 $64.00 $03.90
4), £one 4 — __ $07.05 74,40 $6450 $05.30
(6) Zonet G765 74,40 $63.75 $97.59
{6) Hold for pickyp ~—e _ $87.05 $69.00 $60.00 NO BID
pitmary bw
RECOMMENDATION BY COUNTY ENGINEER:  —— « ST IMIA
OA
t .
Pr-vmsasowroaemm f‘ G BIDS RECEVED: 2/ /é
Mt » PURCHASING AGENT Page s RUBEN GONZALEZ, SUPERI NT



