## **TABULATION**

ANNUAL BID #2560 : ROAD FLEXIBLE BASE MATERIALS

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON DECEMBER 15, 2016 AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM: MARCH 16, 2016 TO: MARCH 15, 2017 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

	VENDOR'S NAME	· ·	FRONTERA MATERIALS	VULCAN MATERIALS	MARTIN MARIETTA
&			PO BOX 1449	12603 SW FWY,	5710 W. HAUSMAN RD, S# 121
<u></u>	ADDRESS		ELSA, TX 78543	STAFFORD, TX 77477	SAN ANTONIO, TX. 78249
	DESCRIPTION		956-316-8952	281-276-4900	210-208-4070
A.	FLEX . BASE TYPE "E"				
L	CALICHE - GRADE 4				
	1. ZONE 1	PR/C.Y.	\$14.70	NO BID	<b>→</b> \$14.90
	2. ZONE 2	PR/C.Y.	\$15.48	NO BID	<b>→</b> \$14.90
	3. ZONE 3	PR/C.Y.	\$16.56	NO BID	<b>→</b> \$16.53
	4. ZONE 4	PR/C.Y.	\$17.10	NO BID	<b>→</b> \$17.10
	5. ZONE 5	PR/C.Y.	\$20.34	NO BID	<b>→</b> \$19.51
B.	CRUSHED LIMESTONE				
	1. ZONE 1	PR/C.Y.	NO BID	<b>→</b> \$43.20	NO BID
	2. ZONE 2	PR/C.Y.	NO BID	→ \$44.30	NO BID
	3. ZONE 3	PR/C.Y.	NO BID	→ \$46.06	NO BID
	4. ZONE 4	PR/C.Y.	NO BID	<b>→→</b> \$47.73	NO BID
	5. ZONE 5	PR/C.Y.	NO BID	→ \$49.05	NO BID

RECOMMENDATION BY COUNTY ENGINEER

**ERNEST HINOJOSA** 

DATE

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:

PAGE 1

MICHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE

RUBEN GONZALEZ, PUBLIC WORKS SUPERINTENDENT

Awarded by Comm. Ct. 02/09/2016