TABULATION

PICK-UP TRUCKS (QTY. -19)SUVs (QTY. - 1) VANS (QTY. -2) - BID # 200101
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: FEBRUARY 25, 2020 AT 11:00 A.M.

cet E

~Type

VENDOR'S NAME TIPTON MOTOR BOSWELL ELLIFF FORD BOGGUS MOTOR
3840 N. EXPRESSWAY 1401 W. BUS. HWY 77 2521 SO EXPRESSWAY 83
ADDRESS BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78523 SAN BENITO, TX. 78686 HARLINGEN, TX. 78550

DESCRIPTION (956)350-5600 {956) 399-2468 (956) 423-2580
DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE

A. PICK-UPS 4X4 Crew Cab 1/2T S/B Mkt. 1eaxEng 2 ea x

Elections 1 ea $128,736,12 $127,085.00 $125,676.00

B. PICK-UPS 4X4 CrewCab 1/2T S/B Pub Wks P1

leax P4 4 ea $168.330.18 $156.875.00 $153,1956.00

C. PICK-UP 4%4 Crew Cab 1/2T S/B - Comm P1 1ea $34,759.03 $34,025.00 $34,219.00

D. PICK-UP 4X4 Extended Cab 1/2 T R/B_- Farm & Home 1ea $3Q,073.03 _ coRR bcT  $29,800.00 $26,634.00

E. PICK-UP 4X4 Extended Cab 112 T L/B - Evira Health 1 68 o [s3388 0329 SYI°2  $20,260.00 ——> 32866000 ¥ |

F. PICK-UP Regular Cab /2T /B - ldg Maint 1 ea . $2\‘5.1Z'}‘.":All}3‘r ) $24,950.00 — $24,619.00

G PICK-UFS 4X4 Crew Cab 1/2 T L/B - Parks 2 ea $64,700.03 $64,080.00 $63,028.00

H. PICK-UP 4%4 Crew Cab 3/4T S/B -Eng DOT itea $31,221.31 ~— $30,050.00 $29,994.00

|. PICK-UP 4X4 Crew Cab 3/4 T [/B - PubWks P2 $31,408.31 $30,200.00 $30,179.00

J TRUCK Serve Body 1T Dually - ldp Mait 1 ea NO B0 $54,500.00 ——— $54,314.00

1, TRUCK Crew Cab 1T RIB - Parks 1 ea $30,891.31 $30,275.00 —% $30.204.00

L SUV 4x4 Full Size - Parks 1ea $45,479.03 NO BID ——3 41,104.00 *1

M VAN CARGO -Bldg Mainl1ea NO BID NQ BID NQ BID

N. VAN CARGO - IT Dept, 1ea $31,504.60 NO BID —> §$31,124.00

A. DELIVERY / DAYS 120-150 60-90 120

B. DELIVERY / DAYS 120150 60-90 120

C. DELIVERY / DAYS 120-150 60-80 120 __

D, DELIVERY/DAYS 120-150 60-90 95

E. DELIVERY / DAYS __ 120-150 60-90 95

F. DELIVERY /DAYS 120-150 60-90 95

G. DELIVERY / DAYS 120-150 60-90 95

H. DELIVERY /[ DAYS 150-180 60-90 100

. DELIVERY / DAYS 150-180 60-90 100

J. DELIVERY / DAYS NO BID 90-120 120

K. DELIVERY [ DAYS 150-180 60-90 100

L. DELIVERY / DAYS 120-150 NO BID 100

M. DELIVERY / DAYS NO BID NO BID NO BID

N. DELIVERY / DAYS 120-160 NQ BID 120

RECOMMENDATION ~ —»

*q - ithin 3% of low - local factor

*2 - low bid non local

| HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:

' 2 [edfy

MIKE FORBES / PURCHASING AGENT DATE

PG. 1

e e
‘L‘D}Eﬁf’)‘ TFLEET MAINT DEPT. DATE




TABULATION

PICK-UP TRUCKS (QTY.-19)SUVs (QTY.-1) VANS (QTY. -2) - BID # 200101

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: FEBRUARY 25, 2020 AT 11:00 A.M.

VENDOR'S NAME SILSBEE FORD CALDWELL CHEVORLET GRAPEVINE DCJ
1211 US HWY. 96 NORTH P Q. BOX 27, 2001 WILLIAM TATE,
ADDRESS SILSBEE, TX, 77656 CALDWELL, TX, GRAPEVINE, TX. 76051
DESCRIPTION {612) 456-1313 (979)567-6116 (819) 410-7541
DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE

A. PICK-UPS 4X4 Crew Cab 1/2 T S/BMkt. tea  xEng 2

ca x Elections 1 ea $126,595.00 —— $107,100.00 $114,492.00
B, PICK-UPS 4X4 CrewCab 12T S/B Pub Wks P1

iea x P4 4ea $152,175.00 $139,875.00 . $143.115.00
C. PICK-UP 4Xd4 Crew Cab 1/2 T S/ - Comm P1 1ea $34.070.00 $35,335.00 $32,125.00
D. PICK-UP 4X4 Extended Cab1/2T R/B - Farm & Home 1ea $32,6198.00 $27.5675.00 — $27,187.00
E PICK-UP 4X4 Extendad Cab 1/2 T L/B - Eviro Health 1 ea $28.449.00 NO BID NO BID

F. PICK-UP Reqular Cah 1/27T L/B - ldg Maint 1 ea $24,963.00 $24,870.00 $24,692,00
G. PICK-UPS 4X4 Crew Cgb 1/2T LIB - Parks 2 ea $63,470.00 $56,760.00 — > $54,858,00
H PICK-UP 4%4 Crew Cab 34T §/B - Eng. DOT 1tea $30,375.00 NO BID $31,065.00
|, PICK-UP 4Xd4 Craw Cab3/4 T L/B - PubWks P2 $30,475.00 NO BID — $27.729.00
lJ. TRUCK Serve Body 1 T_Dually - 1dg Mait. 1 ca NO BID NO BID $69,547.00
K. TRUCK Crew Ceb 1T R/B - Parks 1 ea $30,805.00 NO BID $39,358.00
L. SUV 4X4 Full Size - Parks 1 8a $40,224.,00 *2 $41,170.00 NO BID

M. VAN CARGO - Bldg Mainl1ea —-—— §29,390.00 NO BID NO BID

N, VAN CARGO - [T Depl, 1ea $31,955.00 NO BID NO EID

A. DELIVERY /DAYS 90-120 120 75-100

B8. DELIVERY / DAYS 90-120 120 75-100

C. DELIVERY /DAYS 890-120 120 75-100

0. DELIVERY / DAYS 90-120 120 150-175

E. DELIVERY /DAYS 90-120 NQ BID NO BID

F. DELIVERY /DAYS 80-120 120 75-100

G. DELIVERY ! DAYS 90-120 120 75-100

H. DELIVERY /DAYS 90-120 NOQ BID 75-100

. DELIVERY / DAYS 80-120 NO BID 75-100

J. DELIVERY [ DAYS NO BID NO BID 100-120

K. DELIVERY / DAYS 90-120 NO BID 75-100

L. DELIVERY / DAYS 90-120 150 NO BID

M. DELIVERY [ DAYS 90-120 NO BID NO BID

M. DELIVERY /DAYS 90-120 NO BID NO BID

RECOMMENDATION ~ —»

*{ - low local within 3% of low - local factor
*2 . low hid non local

| HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:

e 7,/% (ao

MIKE FORBES / PURCHASING AGENT DATE'

PG. 2

o5
EE’L?ZANO /FLEET MAINT DEFT. DATE




