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BUILDING SUPPLIES: ELECTRICAL - ANNUAL BID # 2000-2
ER BIDS RECEIVED ON:DECEMBER 6, 2016 AT 11:00 A.M.

AS P
FROM: JANUARY 23, 2017 TO: JANUARY 22, 2018 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (ONE) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL,
VENDOR ELECTRIC FIXTURE BUSH SUPPLY
ADDRESS 810 E. 11th. 8t, 2781 ROBINDALE RD.,
BROWNSVILLE, TX, 78522 BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78526
- DESCRIPTION (956) 546-2401 (956) 831-3441
i PRIMARY VENDOR - ELECTRICAL U/M | atypriye. Total pil yr. Total pr/ yr.
1. |FUSES
1|FRS-R-30 600 VRK TD 30 EA $180.00 $393.30
218¢-15 600V CLASS G 30 EA $45.00 $203.70
3|FRN-R-30 250V TD 60 EA $240.00 $355,20
415C-30 300V CLASS G 30 EA $52.50 $381.30
T 5[5C-20 600V CLASS G 20 | EA $35.00 $165.40
6K TK-R-15 GOOV MINITURE 30 EA $240.00 $428.10
“7|KTK-10 600V MINITURE 50 | EA $126.00 $657.50
8|MDL-3 250V SMALL DIM 3A 250V SLOW BLOW 30 EA $18.00 $109.20
alFRN-R-60 250V RK5 TD G0A 60 EA $270.00 $648.00
10| K TK-R-10 600V MINITURE 30 EA $225.00 $435.00
11|FRN-R-45 250V RK5TD 20 EA $52.00 $223.60
12| FRN-R-150 250V RK35 20 EA $227.20 $320.60
13|FRS-R-100 600V RK. TD 30 EA $570.00 $418,50
14| FRS-R-200 600V'RKS 20 EA $400.00 $558.00
SUB-TOTAL ITEM L —» $2,679.70 $5,297.40
11 [SQUARE D BREAKERS
1 OOI2USP-120/240V-20C 30 EA NO BID $222.60
21D223NRB 100A-240V RT 5 EA NO BID $624.35
3]Q0220 2P-120/240V-20A CB 30 EA NO BID $448.10
400250 2P-120/240V-50A CB 15 EA NO BID $244.05
5]Q0B120 SP-120/240V-20A CB 20 EA NO BID $475.00
600115 SP-120/240V-15A CB 50 EA NO BID $356.50
7100130 §P-120/240V-30A CB 50 EA NO BID $420.00
glHOM260 2P-120/240V-60A CB 20 EA NO BID $178.00
1002020 SP-2020A CB 15 EA NO BID $666.75
10]QO816L100S SFC LD-CNTR 10 EA NO BID $474.70
111Q0!1 12L125G LD CNTR 10 EA NO BID $398.70
12 00120L125G LD-CNTR 5 EA NO BID $293.40
13[Q0315 3P-240V-15A CB 15 EA NO BID $1,827.30
14]D22INRB 30A-240V3SN 5 EA NO BID $260.00
15|D224NRB 200A-240V RT 5 EA NO BID $1,692.95
161D321NRB 30A-240V 4SN 5 LA NO BID $413.35
171Q0280 2P-120/240V-80A CB 5 EA NO BID $313.10
18lIPK9GTA GRNDG BARKIT 15 EA NO BID $96.90
19]D223N 100A-240V-3SN 5 EA NO BID $601.00
20|D322NRB 60A-240V-4SN-RT SW EA NO BID $622.15
21100370 3P-240V-70A CB 10 EA NO BID $1,335.00
22100230 2P-120/240V-30A CB 15 EA NO BID $244.05
SUB-TOTAL ITEM 11 NO BID $12,107.95
RECOMMENDATION —p
| HEREBY LZERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:
Gl 1220t vl //m

€ ;
MICHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING ~ DATE ( .?Jér: (PEPE) JONTRERAS - BUILDING MAINTENANCE MANAGER
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BUILDING SUPPLIES: ELECTRICAL - ANNUAL BID # 2000-2
AS PER BID'S RECEIVED ON:DECEMBER 6, 2016 AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM: JANUARY 23, 2017 TO: JANUARY 22, 2018 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (ONE) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL.

ELECTRIC FIXTURE BUSH SUPPLY
810 E. 11th. 5t, 2781 ROBINDALE RD.,
BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78522 BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78526
{956) 546-2401 (9566) 831-3441
( Continued) Primary Vendor - Electrical UM | oty peyr. Total pr/ yr. Total prl yr.
11 |CUTLER- HAMMER & ITE BREAKERS
11C11120 SP-20A-120Y CB 50 |__EA $225.00 NO BID
5|CH250 2P-50A-240V CB 25 |__EA $206.25 NO BID
3| CH230 2P-30A-240Y CB 30 | _FA §247.50 NOBID
SUB-TOTALITEM 111 —> $678.75 NO BID
1V [EMERGENCY LIGHT FIXTURES
CCS WHT EMERGENCY LIGHTING UNIT 10 _|__EA §722.50 T203,70
SUB-TOTAL ITEM IV —p $122.50 520370
v _|MISCELLANEQUS
71312 BULK YELLOW WIRE CONNECTORS 500 12000 | EA $760.00 $49.10
21512 BULK RED WIRE CONNECTORS 500 BAG 120001 EA $200.00 $55.30
2130-273 SIZE 738 ORANGE WIRE CONNECTORS 110001 EA $120.00 $21.65
a1 " ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING 2000 ] _EA $700.00 $1,108.00
511" ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING 1000 | _EA $400.00 3960.40
61172« EMT ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING 30 P $570.00 $963.00
714" DIECAST SET SCREW 100 |_PA §45.00 $104.25
ol ONE HOLE ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING | 300 | EA $36.00 $1830
olys00 RACEWAY WIREMOLD TUBING 300 | EA $36.00 $315.00
T0F4 ONEHOLE ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING | 300 1 _EA $30.00 $30.70
1113/8” BX METALLIC CABLE CONNECTORS 100 | _FA $50.00 $33.15
1202 EMT DIECAST SET SCREW CONNECTORS 300 |__EA §75.00 §148.11
1304 EMTDIECAST SET SCREW CONNECTORS 300 | EA §60.00 $89.25
14]V504 WIREMOLD TUBING 2 HOLE STRAPS 50 | _FA $250 $13.38
15]CR20 NEMAS 20A_TVORY DUPLEX 100 | _EA $135.00 $126.67
16]%" LIOUID TITE FLEXIBLE TUBING 300 |_EA $720.00 “ 515444
171v700 RACEWAY WIREMOLD TUBING 100 | _EA $15.00 §ITa87
18117 EMT DIECAST COMPRESSION COUPLINS 50 |_EA §12.50 $54 58
19]5/8” RAISE SINGLE POLE PLASTER RINGS so_ | EA §10.00 $22.15

RECOMMENDATION —>

| Hmmmnw THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVEV)/ /
( - (2] 20 “ am//m

WICHARL FORBES, PURCHASING DATE ( J?Emﬁl'ﬁj CONTRERAS - BUILDING MAINTENANCE MANAGER
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BUILDING SUPPLIES: ELECTRICAL - ANNUAL BID # 2000-2
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON:DECEMBER 6, 2016 AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM: JANUARY 23, 2017 TO: JANUARY 22, 2018 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE

FOR (ONE) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL.

BUSH SUPPLY

ELEGTRIC FIXTURE
810 E. 11th. St,
BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78522
(956) 546-2401

2781 ROBINDALE RD.,
BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78526
(956) 831-3441

(Continued) Primary Vendor - Electrical

[V, [MISCELLANEOUS (CONTINUED) U/M | atypriyr, Total pr/ yr. Total prl yr.
0] FEMALE CONDUIT CONNECTORS 100 |__EA §15.00 §16.55
7114 X 4 BLANK COVER PLATES 100 |__EA $30.00 52771
22042 REGULAR MANDYBOXES WITH 100 | EA $22.00 $97.57
23| SINGLE GANG BLANK COVERS 100 |__EA $15.00 $36.20

24| DUPLEX RECEPTACLE QUTLET PLATES 100 | _EA $20.00 2730
2517 EMT DIE CAST SET SCREW CONNECTORS 100 | FA $20.00 549,57
26]14"_ CONDUIT CLIPS KADDY 50 EA $2.50 $51.43
27]%" SINGLE GANG KO HANDY BOXES 50 | EA $10.00 $48.79
7814 X 4 JUNCTION BOXES 4" & %" KO - 50 |_EA $50.00 §$32.50
5014 X 4 JUNCTION BOXES %" & %" KQ - DEEP 50 | EA $75.00 §51.00
10|33 + SUPER % X 66 FT3M TAPE 20 | FA $74.00 $90.00
211120V EYE PHOTO CONTROL FIXED POSITION 10_|_EA $55.00 F71.00
12|SINGLE POLE 1202277V_SP20 A 50 1A ~$80.00 $110.00
Y3 WIREMOLD SINGLE GANG BOXES - SHALLOW 1 10 EA §6.00 — §67.50
14| 5/8” _GROUND ROD 10 FA §145.00 $105.60

[ 35|FC6-1PCC Q X_CONNECTORS 50 |__FA $2.00 NO BID
6] VS 1T 2-IN 90D WIREMOLD ELAT ELBOWS 10 | _FA $4.00 $14.70
3la X 4 v & % KOQEXTRA DEEP WCTION 30 | _EA $16.00 NO BID
1815/8” GROUND ROD CLAMPS 10 FA $24.50 1194
190%" PYC FEMALE CONNECTORS 50 | EA $3.00 $9.08
4012” PLASTIC INSULATION BUSHINGS 30 | EA $72.00 $12.00
41 IWIREMOLD FLUSH EXTENSION BOXES 10 | EA $4°50 $60.50
42|SINGLE RECEPTACLE NEMAG-20R WHIT/IV 50| LA $17.00 $755.45
23125DTP-4 1V_10 FOOT POWER POLES 5 LA $173.50 —§644 20
44|V517_2-3/4 WIREMOLD INT’ ELBOWS 5 EA $2775 $9.20
45[Va18 2-1/8 WIREMOLD EXTERNAL ELBOWS 5 EA $2.75 §8.45
a6]165 4 OCT 2-1/8 D OCTAGON JUNCTION BOXES _} 20 1 LA $15.00 $48.53
17|35-YELLOW. % X 66FT MARKING TAPE 10 | EA $1150 %4200
1813 S-ORANGE % X 66FT MARKING TAPE 10 | _EA $T1.50 $42.00
20|35-BROWN % X 66 T MARKING TAPE 10_1_EA $11.50 $42.00
sOIDUPLEX NEMAS 15R RECEPTACLE OUTLETS 50 |_FA $25.00 §25.50
S1IPSA 1! PLASTIC ANCHOR KITS W/ SCREWS 10_|_EA $75.00 ~$64.80
52172-1N SNAP-IN KO BLANK 10 | EA $2.00 $9.17
53|SINGLE QUTLET PLATES 30 | _EA $4.80 $36.00
4| WHITE RANGE HOOD EXHALUST 5 EA $10Z.50 NO BID
55|SINGLE RE! - - HIT/LY 50 EA $25.00 5114.15
56|72 EMT DIE CAST COMPRESSION 50 FA $7.50 ~$50.00
571125V 40A TIMER 3 FA $22.35 §149.13
58| WIREMOLD SINGLE GANG BOXES - SHALLOW 5 EA $2.75 $33.75

SUB-TOTAL ITEM V —p $3,973.40 $6,858.22

Trade Service - 80 % off list

Trade Service - 50 % off list

[_ Miscellaneous Catalog Discount
RECOMMENDATION -

| HERE ERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE COJ RECT BIDS RECEIVED:
- ]152" l6
T

P Mtocinz

MICHAEL FORBES , PURCHASING DA'f‘l:

Awarded by Commissioner's Court 01/10/2017
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TABULATION

BUILDING SUPPLIES: ELECTRICAL - ANNUAL BID # 2000-2
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON:DECEMBER 6, 2016 AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM: JANUARY 23, 2017 TO: JANUARY 22, 2018 W/ OPTION TO RE ACH RENEWAL.

NEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (ONE) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ E

VENDOR ELECTRIC FIXTURE BUSH SUPPLY
ADDRESS 810 E. 11th. St, 2781 ROBINDALE RD.,
BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78622 BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78526
DESCRIPTION {956) 546-2401 (956) B31-3441
SECONDARY VENDOR - ELECTRICAL UM | atypriyr. Total prl yr. Total pr/ yr.
1. |FUSES
1|FRS-R-30 600 V RK TD 24 EA NO BID $393.30
21SC-15 600V CLASS G 24 EA NO BID $203.70
3| FRN-R-30 250V TD 48 EA NO BID $355.20
"~ 4|SC-30 300V CLASS G 24 EA NO BID $381.30
| 5 SC-20 600V CLASS G 16 EA NO BID $165.40
6IKTK-R-15 600V MINITURE 24 EA NO BID $428.10
7[KTK-10 600V MINITURE 40 EA NO BID $657.50
5IMDL-3 250V SMALL DIM 3A 250V SLOW BLOW | 24 EA NO BID $109.20
ol FRN-R-60 250V RKS5 TD 60A 48 EA NO BID $648.00
10| KTK-R-10 600V MINITURE 24 EA NO BID $435.00
[ 71|FRN-R-45 250V RK5 TD 16 | EA NO BID $223.60
12]FRN-R-150 250V RKS 16 EA NO BID $320.60
13|FRS-R-100 600V RK TD 24 EA NO BID $418.50
14]FRS-R-200 600V RKS5 16 EA NO BID $558.00
SUB-TOTAL ITEM L —»  $5,297.40
Il |SQUARE D BREAKERS
SUB-TOTAL ITEM 11 NO BID NO BID

RECOMMENDATION —>

| HEW,LRTH-Y THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED: /{ /
fL.- (22oft oLt

MICHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING DATE JO {F‘E@} CONTRERAS - BUILDING MAINTENANCE MANAGER

Awarded by Commissioner's Court 01/10/2017




BUILDING SUPPLIES: ELECTRICAL - ANNUAL BID # 2000-2
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON:DECEMBER 6, 2016 AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM:; JANUARY 23,2017 TO: JANUARY 22, 2018 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (ONE) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL.

o ELECTRIC FIXTURE BUSH SUPPLY
810 E. 11th. St, 2781 ROBINDALE RD,,
BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78522 BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78526
(956) 546-2401 (956) B31-3441
( Continued) Secondary Vendor - Electrical U/M | aty priye. Total prl yr. Total pr/ yr.
1 [CUTLER- HAMMER & ITE BREAKERS
SUR-TOTAL ITEM 111 NO BID NO BID
v |[EMERGENCY LIGHT FIXTURES
CCS WHT EMERGENCY LIGHTING UNIT 8 EA NOBID NO BID
SUB-TOTAL ITEM 1V NO BID NO BID
v |IMISCELLANEOUS
11312 BULK YELLOW WIRE CONNECTORS 500 1600 EA NO BID NO BID ]
272|512 BULK RED WIRE CONNECTORS 500 BAG 1600 EA NO BID NO BiD
3[30-273 SIZE 73B ORANGE WIRE CONNECTORS 800 EA
500 BAG NO BID NO BID
4]% ¢ ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING 1600 | EA NO BID NO BID
/2% EMT ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING 2400 FT NO BID NO BID
5117 ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING 800 EA NO BID NO BID
6|27 DIECAST SET SCREW 240 EA NO BID NO BID
7% ONE HOLE ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING | 240 FT
STRAP NO BID NO BID
g|v500 RACEWAY WIREMOLD TUBING 240 EA NO BID NO BID
9l ONE HOLE ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING | 240 EA
STRAP NO BID NO BID
10[3/8” BX METALLIC CABLE CONNECTORS 80 EA NO BID NO BID |
111%" EMT DIECAST SET SCREW CONNECTORS 240 EA NO BID NO BID
12|77 EMT DIECAST SET SCREW CONNECTORS 240 EA NO BID NO BID
13]v504 WIREMOLD TUBING 2 HOLE STRAPS 40 EA NO BID NO BID
14|CR20 NEMAS5 20A JVORY DUPLEX 80 EA NO BID NO BID
15[ LIQUID TITE FLEXIBLE TUBING 240 EA NO BID NO BID
16|v700 RACEWAY WIREMOLD TUBING 80 EA NO BID NO BID
17|17 EMT DIECAST COMPRESSION COUPLINS 40 EA NO BID NO BID
18]5/8” RAISE SINGLE POLE PLASTER RINGS 40 EA NO BID NO BID
RECOMMENDATION —

] I-IL’I'{WHTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE GORRELT BIDS RECEIVED: n// /
: X . (2—) (A 17 fY I A

ICHAEL FORBES , PURCHASING  DATE / 10s(PEEE) CONTRERAS - BUILDING MAINTENANCE MANAGER

§

Awarded by Commissioner's Court 01/10/2017




BUILDING SUPPLIES: ELECTRICAL - ANNUAL BID # 2000-2
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON:DECEMBER 6, 2016 AT 11:00 A,M.

FROM: JANUARY 23, 2017 TO: JANUARY 22, 2018 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (ONE) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL.

il ELECTRIC FIXTURE BUSH SUPPLY
810 E. 11th. St, 2781 ROBINDALE RO,
BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78522 BROWNSVILLE, TX, 78526
(Continued) Secondary Vendor - Electrical (956) 546-2401 (956) 831-3441
v, [MISCELLANEOUS (CONTINUED) um | atypriyr. Total pi!f yr. Total pt/ yr,
19 172" EMT CONNECTORS, SET SCREW, STEEL 80 EA NO 8ID NO BID
2014 X 4 BLANK COVER PLATES 80 EA NO BID NO BID
21114 REGULAR HANDYBOXES W/KNOCKOUTS 80 EA NO BID NO BID
72|SINGLE GANG BLANK COVERS 80 EA NO BID NO BID
53|DUPLEX RECEPTACLE QUTLET PLATES 80 EA NO BID NO BID
24|%» EMT DIE CAST SET SCREW CONNECTORS 80 EA NO BID NO BID T
25|14” CONDUIT CLIPS KADDY 40 EA NO BID NO BID
26| SINGLE GANG KO HANDY BOXES 40 EA NO BID NO BID
7714 X 4 JUNCTION BOXES 2" & ¥ KO - 40 EA NO BID NO BID
2814 X 4 JUNCTION BOXES %" & % KO - DEEP 40 EA NO BID NO BID
29/33 + SUPER %4 X 66__FT 3M TAPE 16 EA NO BID NO BID
30[120V EYE PHOTO CONTROL FIXED POSITION CELLS 8 EA NO BID NO BID
31|SINGLE POLE 1201277V SP20 A 40 EA NO BID NO BID
32| WIREMOLD SINGLE GANG BOXES - SHALLOW 8 EA NO BID NO BID
3315/8” GROUND ROD 8 EA NO BID NO BID
34|FC6-1PC CRIMP ON COAX CONNECTORS 40 EA NO BID NO BID
351V511 2-IN 90D WIREMOLD FLAT ELBOWS 8 EA NO BID NQ BID
GlaX 4 B & W KO EXTRA DEEP JUCTION BX | 24 EA NO BID NO BID
3715/8” GROUND ROD CLAMPS 8 EA NO BID NO BID
384" PVC FEMALE CONMECTORS 40 EA NO BID NO BID
39|2" PLASTIC INSULATION BUSHINGS 24 EA NO BID NO BID
40lWIREMOLD FLUSH EXTENSION BOXES 8 EA NO BID NO BID
41ISINGLE RECEPTACLE NEMAG-20R WHIT/IV 40 EA NO BID NO BID
42125DTP-4 IV 10 FOOT POWER POLES 4 EA NO BID NO BID
43|V517 2-3/4 WIREMOLD INTERNAL ELBOWS 4 EA NO BID NO BID
44]V518 2-1!LW1REMOLD EXTERNAL ELBOWS 4 EA NO BID NQO BiD
45]1654 OCT 2-1/8 D OCTAGON JUNCTION BOXES % KO 16 EA NO BID NO BID
46]|35-YELLOW % X 66FT MARKING TAPE 8 EA NO BID NO BID
47|35-ORANGE % X 66FT MARKING TAPE 8 EA NO BID NO BID
48[35-BROWN % X 66FT MARKING TAPE 8 EA NO BID NO BID
49]|DUPLEX NEMAS 15R RECEPTACLE OUTLETS 40 EA NO BID NO BID
50|PSA1J PLASTIC ANCHOR KITS W/ SCREWS 8 EA NO BID NO BID
5112-IN SNAP-IN KO BLANK 8 EA NO BID NQ B{D
52| SINGLE DUPLEX RECEPTACLE OUTLET 24 EA NO BID NO BID
53|REGULAR RESIDENTIAL 36" RANGE HOOD WHAV 4 EA NO BID NO BID
54|SINGLE RECEPTACLE NEMAS5-20R WHIT/IV 40 EA NO BID NO BID
&50%4" EMT DIE CAST COMPRESSION CONNECTORS 40 EA NO BID NO BID
561125V 40A TIMER 2 EA NO BID NO BID
57| WIREMOLD SINGLE GANG BOXES - SHALLOW 4 EA NO BID NO BID
SUB-TOTAL ITEM V NO BID NO BID
Miscellaneous Catalog Discount

RECOMMENDATION —>

| HEW!TIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE C;RRECT BIDS RECEIVED: /?/ /
e (2% ZC:/fG - Wpou 2 vl e

MICHAEL FORBES . PURCHASING  DATE: (josE fEPE}'iQNTRERAS - BUILDING MAINTENANCE MANAGER
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Cameron County Commissioners’ Court

Agenda Request Form
A A No.
C“ y
Date: )2 }20 /((9 Meeting Date Request: [ )’/o /( 7
Deadline for Action: L IContact Person: ____r\_/lic]_ﬁg_linlrl_:_csi_
Department: Purchasing Phone: 544-0871 ) Fax: _550-7219
Department Head Name: Michael Forbes Signature: ! ¥

Cantion: Awarded by Commissioner's Court 01/10/2017

Consideration and authorization to utilize the following Interlocal Cooperative Purchasing Agreements
as Back-up /Secondary sources for the following: Electrical Supplies.

Graybar Electric ~ US Communities

Home Depot — US Communities

Dealer’s Electric — Region 19 PACE
Border States Industries — Region 19 PACE
Johnson Supply — Buy Board

Kimball Midwest — Buy Board

Grainger — Buy Board

CC Distributors — Buy Board

Crawford Electric — Buy Board

Lawson — TXMAS

Backgro und: (Briefly summarize your request, if needed use separate sheet(s) or attach supporting documentation).

PLEASE FILL IN ALL BMNKS S WITH REQUIRED INI TIALS AND. FISCAL DA TA INFORMA TION
OR PLACE N/A IF IS NOT APPLICABLE:

Human
County Judge  Auditor Budget Legal Resources Purchasing o
1295 Form
Fiscal Data: Funds From:
Dept. Name: Fund No. Department: Yes ~ No __ Amt. Expended 1§
Funds Available: Yes  No General: Yes ~ No lmpdct on future budget: Yes __No___

Grant: Yes No

Comments:

Action taken by Commissioners’ Court
Approved ~ Tabled Denied ~ Motion made by ) Secconded  Vote




