TABULATION

ANNUAL BID # 2460 - RECYCLED STOCK 8 COPIER PAPER, ENVELOPES

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON OCTOBER 10, 2017 AT 14:00 A.M.

FROM: NOVEMBER 1, 2017 TO: NOVEMBER 1, 2018 WITH TWO (2) RENEWAL OPTIONS ONE (1) YEAR EACH.
OPEN MARKET PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED *

VENDOR'S NAME WESTERN BOSWORTH PAPER FAS CLAMPITT PAPER GULF COAST PAPER
ADDRESS ANNUAL | 6301 E, STASSNEY LANE, BLDG 9 2700 N, McCOLL, 635 BILLY MITCHELL BLVD.,,
DESCRIPTION QTy. AUSTIN, TX. 78744 McALLEN, TX. 78501 BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78521
GSs. (877) 274-0968 (956) 618-5539 (956) 541-2281
A |RECYCLED 25% COTTON PAPER
{m) 8 1/2 X 11 SUB 24 25% COTTON 25 $3,330.00 $3,051.25 NO/BID
| |A. TOTAL $3,330,00 e §3,051.26 NO/BEID
B |RECYCLED ENVELOPES
() #10 SUB 24 LITHO- WOVE - SIDE SEAM 100 $4,620.00 §4,015.00 $477.00
{b) #10 SUB 24 WINDOW-LITHO WOVE-SIDE 30 §1,589.00 $1.440.00 NO/BID
(€Y MANILA ENVELOPES 6 112 X 9 1/2 Sub 28 &mien §316.20 NO/BID $803.40
(d) MANILA ENVELOPES 9 X 12 Sub 28 6mlea $357.90 §578.52 $857.40
B. TOTAL 6,893.10 — $6,033.52 §2,137.80
C |NON-RECYGLED INDEX CARDS
{a) 8 X 11 SUB 110 WHITE INDEX 150m/ea §3,541.50 $3,300.00 34,808,00
(b).8 X 14 SUB 110 WHITE INDEX 80m/ea $1.928.40 $1,800.00 NO BID
(c) 8 1/2 X 11 SUB 90 WHITE INDEX 50m/ea $965.50 $900.00 $1,468.00
(d) 8 1/ 2 % 14 SUB 90 WHITE INDEX 40m/ea $1.062.00 $980.00 NO BID
COLOR INDEX:
{e) 8 1/2 x 11 INDEX SUB 110 50m/ea $1.246.00 $1,175.00 NO BID
ASTRO BRIGHT COLORS:
{18 1/2 x 11_INDEX SUH 65 Cover 40m/ ea $1,100,80 $1,280 40 §2,188.80
ROYAL LINEN 1
{g) & 1/2 x 11 SUB 80 IVORY COVER 40m/ea 52,132.80 $1,968.80 NO BID
(h) 8 1/2 x 14 SUB 80 WHITE COVER 40miea §2,132.80 $1,968 80 ND BID
C. TOTAL $14,099.80 — $13,373.00 INC.
D |[NCR NON-RECYCLED PARER SUPERIOR
{a) 8 1/2 X 11 PRECOLLATED - 2 PART 80 $5,620.00 §6,240.00 514,315.20
(b) B 1/2_ X 14 PRECOLLATED - 2 PART 30 §2,680.50 $3,558.00 NO BID
{c) 8 1/2 X 11 PRECOLLATED - 3 PART 40 $3,164.00 $3,526.00 NO BID
(d)'8 1/2 X 14 PRECOLLATED - 3 PART ' 10 $1,006.50 $1,338.50 NO BID
(6) 8 1/2 % 11 PRECOLLATED - 4 PART 15 $1.267.50 $1,413.75 NO BID
(N8 1/2 X 14 PRECOLLATED - 4 PART 5] $546.60 $715.75 NO BID !
D. TOTAL $14,285.00 — $186,792.00 INC.
£ [COLOR PAPER RECYCLED BCW 30%
(2)B 172X 11-20LB 5mlea $1.170.00 §1,050.00 51,355.00
E. TOTAL $1,170.00 —> $1,050.00 $1,355.00
MISC 15% 25% 15-25 %
RECOMMENDATION —r "

1 . orders placad must exceed $500 Lo avold dellvery charges

| HERE ffRTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT PR?F'O?M.S RECEIVED:
fo/rz /"7

WICHM:(' FORBES, ASST. AUDITOR / PURCHASING DATE 7 LEO POMPA  REPRODUCTION DEPT. HEAD

AWARDED BY COMMISSIONER'S COURT 0/30/2017



