BID # 250103 - PURCHASE OF VEHICLES FOR CAMERON COUNTY DEPARTMENTS

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON February 26, 2025 AT 3:00 P.M.

TABULATION SHEET

PRIMARY

SECONDARY

TERTIARY

TIPS 240901 REGION

TIPS 240901  SOURCEWELL
TIPS COOPERATIVE  Contract 032824-0LA GOODBUY 25. | 7 ESCVHE2425 SHERIFF'S EQUALIS GROUP LLC
TIPS COOPERATIVE Contract No 240901 TIPS COOPERATIVE Contract " | ASSOCIATION OF TEXAS 25- Contract No C0G-21228
No 240901 No 240901 8F000 06-1010 SOURCEWELL 030122
BOSWELL ELLIFF FORD SAMES LAREDO CHEVROLET CALDWELL COUNRTY GRAPVINE DCJ, LLC SAMES MCALLEN FORD SILSBEE FORD SILSBEE FORD GUNN NISSAN WISCHNEWSKY CHRYSLER CZAR COMPANIES LLC ELEMENT FLEET FOUNDATION CDIR &
CHEVROLET OLATHE FORD SALES INC. DODGE JEEP RAM MANAGEMENT FOUNDATION GMS LEGACY BROTHERS, INC.
10200 Grand Central Ave.
1401 W. Business HWY77 3701 E. Sanders St. 800 e. hwy21 2601 WILLIAM D. TATE 1400 E. US HWY 83 1211U.5. HWY 96 N 1211U.5. HWY 96 N 750 N.E. Loop 410 1845 E. Santa Fe 151 Interstate 45 North 2102 Thornton St. Suite 400 2900 Old Jacksboro HWY 407 N. Peterson Ave.

San Benito, Texas 78586
Rep- Robert Garcia

Laredo, Texas 78041
Rep- David Lowry

Caldwell, Texas 77836
Rep- Kaybee Ingram

Grapevine, TX 76051
Rep-Dennis Thomas

McAllen, Texas 78501
Rep- Raul Gonzalez

Silsbee, Texas 77656
Rep- Michael Wiley

Silsbee, Texas 77656
Rep- Michael Wiley

San Antonio, Texas 78209
Rep- Jose L. Castillo

Olathe, KS 66062
Rep- Sandra Gonzalez

Huntsville, Texas 77320
Rep-Michael J. Man

Cameron, Texas 76520
Rep- Ben Laureano

Owings Mills, MO 21117
Rep- Brian Hamby

Whichita Falls, Texas 76302
Rep- Henry Broadus

Douglas, GA 31533
Rep- Micah Trexler

VEHICLE DESCRIPTION: DEPARTMENT QTY__ COLOR 956-399-2468 956-482-7507 979-567-1500 817-410-7541 956-686-7411 254-541-9061 254-541-9061 210-254-5629 505-850-5504 936-205-2277 x2030 979-567-1500 205-962-2924 940-228-4448 772:577-1816
CATEGORY A [2025 ize Pickup truck, Crew Cab (4 doors), 2WD, Long Bed - Alternate Option 4xd 2025 Ford Maverick XL 2025 Chevy Colorado 2024 Chevrolet Colorado N/A 2025 FORD RANGER 2025 Ford Ranger 2025 Ford Ranger N/A 2025 Ford Ranger N/A N/A 2025 Ford Ranger 2025 GMC Canyon Elevation 2025 Ford Ranger
2025 Mid-size Pickup truck, Crew Cab (4 doors), 2WD, Long Bed Maintenance & Operations 1 White $26,884.00 $32,400.00 $34,950.00 NO BID $32,230.00 $35,600.00 $36,268.00 NO BID $31,991.00 NO BID NO BID $34,636.59 $42,314.70 $43,822.00
2025 Mid-size Pickup truck, Single Cab (4 doors), 2WD, Long Bed Parks & Recreations 1 White NO BID $32,400.00 $34,950.00 Crew Cab NO BID $32,230.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $31,991.00 NO BID NO BID $34,636.59 $42,314.70 NO BID
2025 Mid-size Pickup truck, Crew Cab (4 doors), 4x4, Long Bed Misc Departments 1 White $28,161.00 NO BID $37,950.00 NO BID $35,393.00 $38,000.00 $38,780.75 NO BID $35,254.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $45,679.00 $48,083.00
DELIVERY 60-90 days No Delivery specified April/May 2025 N/A 90-120Days 120-150 Days 120-150 Days N/A July 14, 2025 or sooner N/A N/A 16-20 WEEKS 112-140Days 1-May-25 180Days
CATEGORY B Iﬂzs 1/4 Ton (1500) Single (2 door) and/or Crew Cab (4 door), Reg. or Long Bed, 2WD or 4x4, V6 or V8 2025 Ford F150 XL 2025 Chevy Silverado 1500 2025 Chevy Silverado 1500 2024 & 2025 RAM 1500 2025 FORD F150 2025 Ford F150 XL 2025 Ford F150 XL N/A 2025 Ford F150 N/A 2025 RAM 1500 2025 Ford F150 XL 2025 GMC Sierra 2025 Ford F150 XL
2025 FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Single Cab (2 doors), 2WD, Long Bed, Pickup Truck V6 Maintenance & Ops 1 White $34,562.00 $35,900.00 $37,700.00 NO BID $36,855.00 $38,600.00 $39,546.25 NO BID $37,038.00 NO BID NO BID $36,285.50 $42,838.63 $58,870.00
2025 FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Single Cab (2 doors), 2WD, Long Bed, Pickup Truck V8 Alternate Option &0ps 1 White $36,115.00 $38,300.00 $39,950.00 NO BID $38,455.00 $40,700.00 $41,503.25 NO BID $38,477.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $42,838.63 NO BID
$44,115.00 Yr 2024 White NOBID
2025 FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 44, regular Bed, Pickup Truck V8 Public Works Dept 2 White or Navy Blue $44,334.00 $88,668.00x 2 $44,500.00 $89,000x2 White _$46,350.00 $92,700.00x2 $88,230.00x2 in stock $45,414.00 $90,828.00x2 $47,700.00 $95,400.002W___$48,103.25 $96,206.502W. NO BID $46,683.00 $93,366.002W $48,081.00 $96,162.0062 V6 $46,175.88$92,351.76 x 2 $54,473.10 $108,946.20x2W. $68,071.00 $136,142.00x2
2025 FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 4x4, Long Bed, Pickup Truck V6 Parks & Recreations Dept White $44,459.00 $$88,918.00 x 2 $41,900.00 $83,800.00x2 $44,020.00 $87,840.00x2 NO BID $45,949.00 $91,898.00x2 $47,800.00 $95,600.002W  $48,136.50 $96,273.00x2 V8 NO BID $46,758.00 $93,516.00x2 NO BID $48,826.00 $97,652.00x2 $50,623.87 $101,247.74x 2 $46,747.00 $93,494.00x3 $68,738.00 $137,476.00x2
2025 FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 44, Long Bed, Pickup Truck V8 Alternate Option Parks & Recreations Dept 1 White $44,459.00 $44,500.00 $47,055.00 $46,940.00 $45,949.00 $47,800.00 $48,136.50 NO BID $46,708.00 NO BID $48,826.00 V6 $50,623.87 $60,027.85 $70,595.25
$47,700.00 $95,400.00:2W
2025 FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Extended Cab (4 doors), 4x4, Regular Bed, Pickup Truck V8 Health/Environmental 2 White $43,238.00 $86,476.00x2 ___$44,500.00 $89,000.00x2 CC___$44,560.00 $89,120.00x2 __$44,038.00 $88,076.00x2 $44,655.00 $89,310.00x2 Crew Cab $48,103.25 $96,206.50x2 NO BID $42,171.00 $84,342.00x2 NO BID $45,648.00 $91,206.00¢2 V6 $47,462.25 $94,924.50 X2cc __$51,504.00 $103,188.000x2 $68,071.00 $136,142.00x2
2025 FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 4x4, Regular Bed, Pickup Truck V6 Engineering Dept 1 White or Gray $42,118.00 White, Gray $41,900.00 White $43,730.00 $44,135.00 $44,074.00 $45,800.00 White $46,146.25 White NO BID $46,683.00 NO BID $45,900.00 $40,932.92 White $43,674.00 White $68,071.00
2025 FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 4x4, Regular Bed, Pickup Truck V6 with Bed Camper Alter. Dept 1 White or Gray $45,858.00 White $47,700.00 White $48,580.00 NO BID NO BID $50,800.00 White $51,146.25 White NO BID $52,893.00 White NO BID $50,900.00 NO BID $48,273.00 White NO BID
2025 FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Single Cab (2 doors), 2WD, Long Bed, Pickup Truck V6 Miscellaneous Dept 1 White or Navy Blue $34,562.0 Blue color $35,900.00 White $36,770.00 NO BID $36,855.00 $38,600.00 White NO BID NO BID $37,038.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $43,437.63 White $72,763.00
2025 FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Single Cab (2 doors), 4x4, Long Bed, Pickup Truck V6 Miscellaneous Dept 1 White or Navy Blue $39,113.00 White or Blue $39,700.00 White $41,090.00 NO BID $43,983.00 $42,800.00 White NO BID NO BID $41,739.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $44,146.23 White $65,736.50
2025 FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Single Cab (2 doors), 2WD, Long Bed, Pickup Truck V8 Miscellaneous Dept 1 White or Navy Blue $36,115.00 White or Blue $38,300.00 White $40,310.00 NO BID $38,455.00 $40,700.00 White NO BID NO BID $38,477.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $42,772.63 White $57,930.75
2025 FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Single Cab (2 doors), 4x4, Long Bed, Pickup Truck V8 Miscellaneous Dept 1 White or Navy Blue $40,652.00 White or Blue $42,300.00 White $44,330.00 NO BID $42,410.00 $44,900.00 White NO BID NO BID $42,751.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $44,146.23 White NO BID
2025 FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 2WD, Regular Bed, Pickup Truck V6 Miscellaneous Dept 1 White or Navy Blue $38,592.00 White or Blue $39,400.00 White $40,795.00 $40,995.00 White $40,549.00 $43,800.00 White NO BID NO BID $43,018.00 NO BID $42,311.00 NO BID $40,450.00 White NO BID
2025 FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 4x4, Regular Bed, Pickup Truck V6 Miscellaneous Dept 1 White or Navy Blue $42,118.00 White or Blue $42,200.00 White $43,730.00 $44,135.00 White $44,074.00 $45,800.00 White NO BID NO BID $45,842.00 NO BID $45,900.00 NO BID $43,674.00 White $69,008.00
2025 FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 2WD, Regular Bed, Pickup Truck V8 Miscellaneous Dept 1 White or Navy Blue $40,808.00 White or Blue $42,000.00 $43,535.00 $43,395.00 White $42,324.00 $45,900.00 White NO BID NO BID $43,257.00 NO BID $44,711.00 V6 NO BID $55,072.10 White NO BID
2025 FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 4x4, Regular Bed, Pickup Truck V8 Miscellaneous Dept 1 White or Navy Blue $44,334.00 White or Blue $44,800.00 $46,760.00 $46,535.00 White $45,414.00 $47,700.00 White NO BID NO BID $46,783.00 NO BID $48,081.00 V6 NO BID $59,428.85 White $70,066.00
2025 FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 2WD, Long Bed, Pickup Truck V6 Miscellaneous Dept 1 White or Navy Blue NO BID $38,500.00 $41,150.00 $43,795.00 White $46,275.00 $45,900.00 White NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $45,328.00 NO BID $42,846.00 White NO BID
2025 FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 4x4, Long Bed, Pickup Truck V6 Miscellaneous Dept 1 White or Navy Blue $44,459.00 White or Blue $42,300.00 $44,015.00 $46,940.00 White $45,949.00 $47,800.00 White NO BID NO BID $46,758.00 NO BID $48,826.00 NO BID $43,674.00 White $70,008.00
2025 FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 2WD, Long Bed, Pickup Truck V8 Miscellaneous Dept 1 White or Navy Blue NO BID $42,000.00 $44,180.00 $43,995.00 White $46,275.00 $45,900.00 White or Blue NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $45,021.00 V6 NO BID $55,072.10 White NO BID
2025 FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 4x4, Long Bed, Pickup Truck V8 i Dept 1 White or Navy Blue $44,459.00 White or Blue $45,000.00 $47,055.00 $46,490.00 White $46,275.00 $47,800.00 White or Blue NO BID NO BID $46,708.00 NO BID $48,826.00 V6 NO BID $59,428.85 White $70,641.25
DELIVERY 60-90 Days 90-120 Days May/June 2025 60-80 ARO 90-120 Days 120-180 Days 120-150 Days N/A 16-Jun-25 N/A 90-120 Days 20-24 WEEKS 140-168Days 1Jun25 180 ARO
CATEGORY C [2025 3/ Ton (2500) Crew Cab, Regular & Long Bed, 4x4 & 2WD, Gas & Diesel Engine 2025 Ford F250XL 2025 Chevy Silverado 2500 2024 Chevy Silverado 2500 2025 RAM 2500 2025 FORD F250 2025 Ford F250 2025 Ford F250 2025 Ram 2500 2025 F250XL 2025 RAM 2500 2025 RAM 2500 2025 Ford F250 2025 RAM 2500 2025 Ford 250 XL
2025 3/4 Ton, Crew Cab, Long Bed, 44, Gas Engine, vinyl floor & seats Vehicle Maintenance 1 NavyBlue $48,086.00 $47,800.00 $49,590.00 NO BID $48,827.00 $52,000.00 $53,265.25 Antimater Blue $49,432.00 $48,702.00 Antimatter Blue $48,091.00 $51,448.00 $48,632.89 $56,155.00 $80,189.75
2025 3/4 Ton, Crew Cab, Long Bed, 4x4, viny! floor & seats, - Alternate Option Diesel Engine Vehicle 1 NavyBlue $57,152.00 $56,500.00 $59,000.00 NO BID $57,522.00 $61,000.00 $62,235.50 Antimater Blue $60,646.00 $57,868.00 Antimatter Blue $61,508.00 $62,658.00 NO BID $44,950.00 NO BID
2025 3/4 Ton, Crew Cab, Long Bed, 4x4, Gas Engine, vinyl floor & seats, Public Works Dept., Pct 2 & 3 3 White or Navy Blue $48,086.00 $143,658.00x3 $47,800 $143,400.00x3 $49,590.00 $148,700.00x3  $47,837.00 $143,511.00x3W  $48,827.00 $146,481.00x3  $52,000.00 $156,000.003W  $53,265.25 $159,795.75x3W  $49,432.00 $148,296.00x3  $48,702.00 $146,106.003W  $48,091.00 $144,273.00x38  $51,448.00 $154,344.00x3 $48,632.895145898.67x3  $56,155.00 $168,465.003W $76,301.25 $228,903.753W
2025 3/4 Ton, Crew Cab, Long Bed, 4x4, vinyl floor & seats, - Alternate Diesel Engine Public Works Dept., Pct 2 & 3 3 White or Navy Blue $57,152.00 $171,456.00x3 $56,500.00 $169,500.00x3 _ $59,000.00 $177,000.00x3 _ $58,947.00 $176,841.00x3W __ $57,522.00 $172,566.00x3 __$61,000.00 $183,000.00x3W _ $62,235.50 $186,706.50x3W ___ $60,646.00 $ 181,938.00x3 _$57,868.00 $173,604.003W __$61,508.00 $184,524.00x3 $62,658.00 $187,974.00x3 $44,950.00 $134,850.00x3W
2025 3/4 Ton, Crew Cab, Regular Bed, 2WD, vinyl floor & seats, Gas Engine Miscellaneous Dept 1 White or Navy Blue $45,371.00 $43,500.00 $48,050.00 $45,207.00 White $46,301.00 $49,000.00 White $50,840.25 White $46,602.00 $47,202.00 White $45,457.00 $47,104.00 NO BID $44,950.00 White $78,189.75 White
2025 3/4 Ton, Crew Cab, Regular Bed, 2WD, vinyl floor & seats, Diesel Engine i Dept 1 White or Navy Blue $54,436.00 $53,900.00 $56,150.00 $56,427.00 White $56,796.00 $58,000.00 White $59,810.50 White $55,116.00 $56,368.00 White $56,570.00 $58,314.00 NO BID $56,155.00 White $88,946.25 White
DELIVERY 60-90 Days 90-120 Days May/June 2025 70-110 ARO 90-120 Days 120-150 Days 120-150 Days 90 Days July 14, 2025 or sooner 90 Days 120-150 Days 16-20 WEEKS 112-140Days 1hun25 180 ARO
CATEGORY D Izozs 1 Ton, Single & Crew Cab, Long Bed, 2WD & 4x4, Dual Rear Wheels (Dully) - Service Body Flat Bed Opt. I 2025 Ford F350XL Diesel 2025 Chevy Silverado 350 2024 Chevy Silverado 3500 N/A 2025 FORD F350 N/A N/A N/A N/A 2025 3500 BigHorn 2025 rAM 3500 Tradesman 2025 Ford F350 2025 RAM 3500 2025 Ford F350 XL
2025 1 Ton, Single Cab, Long Bed, 2WD, Dual Rear Wheels (Dully), vinyl floor & seats, Diesel Engine Maintenance & Ops 1 White $53,385.00 $56,100.00 $56,350.00 NO BID $56,749.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $60,576.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $81,919.75
2025 1 Ton, Crew Cab, Long Bed, 2WD, Dual Rear Wheels (Dully), vinyl floor & seats, Diesel Engine &0ps 1 White $57,144.00 $57,800.00 $59,000.00 NO BID $57,795.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $58,277.00 $61,633.00 $60,370.86 $56,430.00 NO BID
2025 1 Ton, Crew Cab, 4x4, Dual Rear Wheels (Dully), vinyl floor & seats, Diesel Engine - flat bed, service body Public Works Dept. Sign Shop 1 White or Navy Blue $74,240.00 $71,600.00 $69,250.00 NO BID $78,557.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $74,000.00 Navy Blue $82,430.00 $60,706.31 White $65,760.00 White $104,611.50 White
2025 1 Ton, Crew Cab, 2WD, Dual Rear Wheels (Dully), viny! floor & seats, Diesel - flat bed, service body Alt Public Works Dept. Sign Shop 1 White or Navy Blue $71,082.00 $66,100.00 $66,950.00 NO BID $75,398.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $80,296.00 Navy Blue $79,430.00 NO BID $71,060.00 White NO BID
2025 1 Ton, Crew Cab, Long Bed, 4x4, dual rear wheels (Dully), vinyl floor & seats, Diesel Engine Miscellaneous Dept 1 White or Navy Blue $59,431.00 $61,600.00 $61,299.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $63,000.00Navy Blue $64,312.00 NO BID $59,060.00White $87,560.50 White
2025 1 Ton, Crew Cab, Long Bed, 2WD, dual rear wheels (Dully), vinyl floor & seats, Diesel Engine Miscellaneous Dept 1 White or Navy Blue $56,873.00 $57,800.00 $58,750.00 NO BID $57,795.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $58,277.00 Navy Blue $61,312.00 NO BID $56,430.00 White $85,260.50 White
2025 1 Ton, Single Cab, Long Bed, 4x4, dual rear wheels (Dully), vinyl floor & seats, Diesel Engine Miscellaneous Dept 1 White or Navy Blue $55,826.00 $58,600.00 $58,420.00 NO BID $57,848.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID $58,282.00 Navy Blue $60,819.00 NOBID $56,305.00 White $81,506.50 White
2025 1 Ton, Single Cab, Long Bed, 2WD, dual rear wheels (Dully), vinyl floor & seats, Diesel Engine i Dept 1 White or Navy Blue $53,299.00 $56,100.00 $56,350.00 NO BID $56,749.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $60,576.00 White $57,819.00 0 BID NO BID $78,285.75 White
DELIVERY 60-90 Days 120-180 Days May/June 2025 N/A 90-120 Days N/A N/A N/A N/A 90 Days 120-150 Days 16-20 WEEKS 112-140Days Thun25 180 ARO
CATEGORY E  [2025 Full Size SUV, 2WD & 4x4, Regular & Long Wheel Base (must seat a minimum of 8 people), Gas Engine | 2025 Ford Expedition Active 2025 Chevy Tahoe 2025 Chevy Suburban LS 2025 Jeep Wagoneer 2025 FORD EXPEDITON XL MAX 2025 Ford Expedition Active 2025 Ford Expedition Active 2025 Jeep Wagoneer 2025 Expedition Active 2025 Jeep Wagoneer 2025 Jeep Wagoneer 2025 Chevy Suburban 2025 Wagoneer 2025 Ford Expedition
2025 Full Size SUV, 2WD, Long Wheel Base. Elections 1 White $56,861.00 $56,400.00 $60,250.00 $57,653.00 $55,047.00 $60,987.00 $61,137.00 $57,365.00 $56,055.00 $57,707.00 $60,475.00 $58,439.00 Sterling Grey M $53,153.00 $90,729.00
2025 Full Size SUV, 2WD, Long Wheel Base. County Clerk 1 White $56,861.00 $56,400.00 $60,250.00 $57,653.00 $55,047.00 $60,987.00 $61,137.00 $57,365.00 $56,055.00 $57,707.00 $60,475.00 $58,439.00 Sterling Grey M $53,153.00 $90,729.00
2025 Full Size SUV, 2WD, Regular Wheel Base Health Dept 1 White $54,124.00 $56,400.00 $60,250.00 $57,653.00 NO BID $57,917.00 $57,917.00 $54,501.00 $56,055.00 $54,507.00 $59,486.00 $55,783.88 Sterling Grey M $50,291.00 $88,792.50
2025 Full Size SUV, 2WD, Long Wheel Base. District Clerk 1 White $56,861.00 $56,400.00 $60,250.00 $57,653.00 $55,047.00 $60,987.00 $61,137.00 $57,365.00 $56,055.00 $57,707.00 $60,475.00 $58,439.74 Sterling Grey M $53,153.00 $90,729.00
2025 Full Size SUV, 2wd, Regular Wheel Base Miscellaneous Dept 1 White $54,124.00 $56,400.00 $60,250.00 $55,396.00 $55,047.00 $57,917.00 $57,917.00 $54,501.00 any color $56,055.00 $54,507.00 $59,486.00 NO BID $50,153.00 $88,792.50
2025 Full Size SUV, 4x4, Regular Wheel Base Depts. - Alternate 1 White $56,861.00 $58,900.00 $63,050.00 $58,748.00 $55,047.00 $60,987.00 $60,767.00 $58,900.00 any color $58,841.00 $56,910.00 $62,363.00 NO BID $53,153.00 $90,011.50
DELIVERY 90 Days 90-180 Days March/April 2025 70-150 Days 90-120 Days 120-150 Days 120-150 Days 90 Days 150 Days 90 Days 120-150 Days 16-18 Weeks 112-126Days 1Jul25 180 ARO
2025 Ford Transit 350 15 2024 Chevy Epress 15 2025 Ford Transit 350 15 2025 Ford Transit 350 15 2025 Fard Transit 15 2025 Ford Transit 350 15
CATEGORY F |zozs Full Size 15 people capacity Passenger Transit Van, 2WD, (High Roof Alternate Option), Gas Engine | passangers 2025 Chevy Express Passenger Passenger Van N/A 2025 FORD TRANSITT350 passangers passangers N/A Passenger Van XLT N/A N/A passangers 2025 GMC 15 Passanger Van 05 Ford Transit 15 Passenger
2025 Full size 15 people capacity passenger van, 2WD, Side slide door, regular roof, Gas engine Juvenile Probation 1 White $54,004.00 $46,900.00 $47,640.00 NO BID $54,450.00 $57,850.00 $57,850.00 NO BID $55,773.00 NO BID NO BID $54,379.97 $53,657.00 $76,417.00
2025 Full size 15 people capacity passenger van, 2WD, Side slide door, Gas engine, High Roof Alternate Juvenile Probation - Alternate 1 White $56,080.00 NO BID $47,640.00 NO BID $56,950.00 $60,035.00 $60,035.00 NO BID $56,676.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $53,657.00 $81,304.50
$54,004.00 White - $57850.00 White NO BID
2025 Full size 15 people capacity passenger van, 2WD, Side slide door, regular roof, Gas engine Miscellaneous Dept 1 White, Gray or Dark Blue $54,204.00 Dark Blue $46,900.00 White $47,640.00 NO BID $54,450.00 g $57,850.00 White NO BID $55,773.00 White NO BID NO BID $53,657.00 White $76,417.00
SN $60,035.00 White NO BID
2025 Full size 15 people capacity passenger van, 2WD, Side slide door, Gas engine, High Roof Alternate Dept - Alternate 1 White, Gray or Dark Blue $$56,280.00 Dark Blue NO BID $47,640.00 NO BID $56,950.00 e $60,035.00 White NO BID $56,676.00 NO BID NO BID $53,657.00 White $81,304.50
DELIVERY 60-90 Das. 90-120 Days April/May 2025 N/A 90-120 Days 120-150 Days 120-150 Days N/A July 14, 2025 or sooner N/A N/A 16-20 WEEKS 112-140Days 1-May-25 180 ARO
2025 Ford Transit 150 Cargo 2024 Chevrolet Express 2025 Ford Transit 150 Cargo
CATEGORY G |1o15 Medium Size Cargo Van, 2WD, Gas Engine Van ¢ 2025 Chevy Express Cargo Cargo Van N/A 2025 Ford Transit T150 N/A N/A 2025 Ram Promaster Cargo Van - 5025 Ford Transit Cargo Van 2025 RAM Promaster 1500 N/A Van 5% 2025 RAM Promaster Cargo Van 2025 Ford Transit Cargo
2025 Medium Size Cargo Van, 2WD, Bulkhead with lockable door Dept 1 White, Gray or Dark Blue $45,717.00 $43,500.00 $39,950.00 NO BID $46,286.00 130 Wheel Base NO BID NO BID $43,625.00 White $48,086.00 White $46,250.00 NO BID $47,537.76 White $46,841.00 White $68,142.75
DELIVERY 60-90 Days 120-180 Days Apr-25 N/A 90-120 Days N/A N/A 90 Days July 14, 2025 or sooner 120 Days N/A 16-20 WEEKS 112-140Days 1Iul25 180 ARO
CATEGORY H [2025 Medium size Crossover vehicle (4 door & 1 rear door) (must seat a minimum of 5 people), Gas Engine | 2025 Ford Escape Active 2026 Chevy Equinox 2025 Chev Equinox N/A 2025 FORD ESCAPE 2025 Ford Escape 2025 Ford Escape Active 2025 Dodge Durango 2025 Active Ford Escape 2025 Grand Cherokee Laredo N/A 2025 Ford Escape 2025 KIA Sportage LX 2025 Ford Escape
$29,611.02 $118,444.08
2025 Medium size Crossover vehicle (4 door & 1 rear door) (must seat a minimum of 5 people) Juvenile Probation 4 White $25,760.00 $103,040.00x4 $27,800.00 $111,200.00x4 ___$27,780.00 $111,120.00x4 NO BID $26,716.00 $106,864.00x4 $29,795.00 $119,180.00x4 __$29,795.00 $119,180.00x4 $41,701.00 $166,804.00x4 $27,187.00 $108,748.00x4___$38,275.00 $ 153,100.00x4 NO BID Carbonized Gray Metallic $29,734.00 $118,936.00x4 $44,354.00 $177,416.00x4
c;i:ﬁ:ﬁgr\?f;\r dB\‘l:::\te 527’800’0'29:/"2;’&3[“"“’ Blue, $29,795.00 White $41,701.00 any color NO BID $29,734.00 White
2025 Medium size Crossover vehicle (4 door & 1 rear door) (must seat a minimum of 5 people) Depts. 1 White, Gray or Dark Blue g $27,780.00 NO BID $26,716.00 Any color $29,795.00 White $27,187.00B,GR, S, blue $38,275.00 White NO BID $44,354.00
DELIVERY 60-90 Days 120-150 Days May/June 2025 N/A 90-120 Days 120-150 Days 120-150 Days 90 Days July 14, 2025 or sooner 90 Days N/A 16-20 WEEKS 112-140Days 1hun25 180 ARO
CATEGORY | [2025 Compact Sedan (Small size), 2WD, 4 door, Gas engine N/A 2025 Chevy Malibu N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 2025 Hyundai Elentra SE N/A N/A Hyundai Elentra 4dr 2025 Kia K4 LS 2025 Honda Civic LX
2025 Compact Sedan (Small size), 2WD, 4 door, Gas engine Miscellaneous Depts. 1 White, Gray or Dark Blue NO BID $25,800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $21,934.00 White NO BID NO BID $20,908.35 Amazon Gray $24,058.00Navy Blue $34,718.25 White
2025 Compact Sedan (Small size), 2WD, 4 door, Gas engine & Ops - Alternate 1 Variety of Colors NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $22,439.00 any color NO BID NO BID $24,058.00 W,5&G NO BID
DELIVERY N/A 30 Days N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A July 14, 2025 or sooner N/A N/A 18-20 Weeks 126-140 Days 1-May-25 180 ARO
CATEGORYJ  [2025 Full Size SUV, Police Package, 4x4, Un-Marked Units, Gas Engine N/A 20252026 Chevy Tahoe 2025 Chevy Tahoe PPV N/A N/A N/A N/A 2025 Durango Pursuit AWD 2025 Chevy Tahoe PPV 2025 Dodge Durango Pursiut 2025 Dodge Durango Pursiut 2025 ChevyTahoe 2025 Durango Pursuit 2025 Chevy Tahoe PPV
2025 Full Size, SUV, 4x4, Police Package, Un-Marked Unit Constable Pct. 1,2,3,485 15 White NO BID $54,400.00 $816,000.00x15 $53,085.00 $796,275.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $45,899.00 $688,485.00x15 ___ $59,970.00 $899,550.00x15 __ $45,712.00 $ 685,680.00x15 ___$44,385.00 $665,775.00x15 __$53,020.56 $795,308.40x15 __$42,796.00 $641,040.00x15 $89,243.00 $1,338,645.00x15
2025 Full Size, SUV, 4x4, Police Package, Un-Marked Unit Sheriff's Office 10 Black NO BID $54,400.00 $544,000.00x10 $53,085.00 $530,850.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $45,899.00 $458,990.00x10 __ $59,970.00 $599,700.00x10 __$45,712.00 $457,120.00x10 __$44,385.00 $443,850.00x10 __$53,020.56 $530,205.60x10 ___$42,796.00 $427,960.00x10 $89,243.00 $892,430.00x10
2025 Full Size, SUV, 4x4, Police Package, Un-Marked Unit Park Ranger 1 Black NO BID $54,400.00 $53,085.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $45,899.00 $59,970.00 $45,712.00 $44,385.00 $53,020.56 $42,796.00 $89,243.00
DELIVERY N/A 180-240 Days. Jul-25 N/A N/A N/A N/A 90 Days. 14-Oct-25 90 Days. 90-120 Days 16-18 Weeks 112-126Days 1-Jul-25 180 ARO
CATEGORY K  [2025 Mid-Size SUV, 2WD & 4x4, (must seat a minimum of 7 people), Gas Engine 2025 Ford Explorer Active 2025 Chevy Traverse 2.5L Turbo 2025 Chevy Traverse N/A 2025 FORD EXPLORER 2025 Ford Explorer 2025 Ford Explorer 2025 Durango GT RWD N/A 2025 Grand Cherokee Laredo 2025 Dodge Durango 2025 Chevy Traverse 2025 Grand Cherokee L 2025 Ford Explorer Platinum
2025 Mid-Size, SUV, 2WD, (must seat a minimum of 7 people), Gas Engine Bridge Department - Veterans 1 White $37,406.00 $38,400.00 $38,925.00 NO BID $38,929.00 $41,529.00 $41,529.00 $39,800.00 NO BID 41,816.00 41,343.00 $39,147.52 $39,108.00 73,619.00
2025 Mid-Size SUV, 4x4, (must seat a minimum of 7 people), Gas Engine Parks Dept 1 White $39,231.00 $40,300.00 $40,830.00 NO BID $41,977.00 $43,429.00 $43,429.00 $42,995.00 NO BID 44,646.00 43,236.00 $40,998.28 $41,506.00 76,743.00
2025 Mid-Size SUV, 2WD, (must seat a minimum of 7 people), Gas Engine Health Dept 1 White $37,406.00 $38,400.00 $38,925.00 NO BID $38,929.00 $41,529.00 $41,529.00 $39,800.00 NO BID 41,816.00 41,343.00 $39,147.52 $39,108.00 73,619.00
2025 Mid-Size SUV, 2WD, (must seat a minimum of 7 people), Gas Engine Miscellaneous Depts. 1 White, Silver or Gray $47,406.00 White Gray $38,400.00 $38,925.00 NO BID $38,929.00 $41,529.00 White $41529.00 White $39,800.00 White NO BID 41,816.00 41,343.00 NO BID $39,108.00 73,619.00
2025 Mid-Size SUV, 4x4, (must seat a minimum of 7 people), Gas Engine i Depts. 1 White, Silver or Gray $39,231.00 White Gray $40,300.00 $40,830.00 NO BID $41,977.00 $43,429.00 W,S&G $43,429.00 White $42,995.00 White NO BID $44,646.00 $43,236.00 BID $41,506.00 $76,749.00
DELIVERY 60-90 Days 90-120 Days June/July 2025 N/A 90-120 Days 120-150 Days 120-150 Days 90 Days N/A 90 Days 90-120 Days 16-18 Weeks 112-126Days 15-May-25 180 ARO
CATEGORY L |2025 1 Ton (3500), Mega Cab, Regular Bed, 2WD & 4x4, Single and Double (Dully Rear Wheels) Gas & Diesel Eng. N/A N/A N/A 2025 RAM 3500 MEGA CAB N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 2025 RAM 3500 MEGA CAB N/A 2025 RAM 3500 2025 RAM Megacab 2025 RAM 3500 Mega cab
White, Silver, Gray, Dark
2025 1 Ton (3500), Mega Cab, Regular Bed, 4x4, Single Rear Wheel, Diesel Eng. Miscellaneous Depts. 1 NavyBlue & Black NO BID NO BID NO BID $78,559.00 W, G & B NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $77,488.00 NO BID $78,767.45 Gray $68,807.00 White $95,666.00 White
White, Silver, Gray, Dark
2025 1 Ton (3500), Mega Cab, Regular Bed, 4x4, Double (Dully Rear Wheels) Diesel Eng. Depts. 1 NavyBlue & Black NO BID NO BID NO BID $81,608.00W, G, & B NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $79,320.00 Dark Navy Blue NO BID $83,003.44 Gray $75,148.00 White $104,172.60 White
DELIVERY N/A N/A N/A 70-120 Days N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Days N/A 8-12 Weeks 56-84 Days 1Jun-25 180 ARO
2025 Chevy Silverado 1500 2025 Ford F150 Police 2025 Ford F150 Police 2025 Ford F150 Police
CATEGORY M |1o15 3/4 Ton (1500) Pickup Truck, Crew Cab, Regular Bed, 4x4, Police Package Unmarked Units | 2025 Ford F150 Police Pack 2025 Chevy Silverado PPV PPV N/A 2025 Ford F150 Responder Responder Responder N/A N/A 2025 1500 Tradesman N/A Responder 2025 RAM Police Pkg 2025 Ford F150 Police Responder
2025 3/4 Ton (1500) Pickup Truck, Crew Cab, Regular Bed, 4xd, Police Package, unmarked Sheriff's Office 1 Black $45,670.00 $49,800.00 $53,755.00 NO BID $48,169.00 $51,342.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $49,900.00 NO BID $48,453.27 $43,305.00 $67,865.00
2025 3/4 Ton (1500) Pickup Truck, Crew Cab, Regular Bed, 4x4, Police Package, unmarked Park Ranger 1 Black $45,670.00 $49,800.00 $53,755.00 NO BID $48,169.00 $51,342.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $49,900.00 NO BID $48,453.27 $43,305.00 $67,865.00
2025 3/4 Ton (1500) Pickup Truck, Crew Cab, Regular Bed, 4x4, Police Package, unmarked i 1 White, Black or Gray $45670.00 WBG $49,800.00 $53,755.00 NO BID $48,169.00 $51,342.00 White $51,342.00 White NO BID NO BID $49,900.00 White, Black NO BID NO BID $43,904.00 $67,865.00
DELIVERY 90 Days 120/150 Days April/May 2025 N/A 90-120 Days 120-150 Days 120-150 Days N/A N/A 120 Days N/A 16-20 WEEKS 112-140Days 1Jun-25 180 ARO
Addendums Received 1,283 1,283 1,283 1,283 1,283 182 182 182 1,283 1,283 1,283 182 1,283 1,283
PRIMARY
RECOMMENDATION SECONDARY
TERTIARY
| HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:
fsberts (o Lina Q/)/
ROBERTO C. LUNA, PURCHASING AGENT / DATE
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