

TABULATION

Month-to-Month Renewal

Term: July 2nd, 2024 to February 28th, 2025

ANNUAL BID #2660 - UNIFORMS: SHERIFF'S / JAILER/ INMATES.

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JUNE 8, 2021 AT 11:00 AM

FROM: AWARD DATE TO: JUNE 16, 2022 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL.



BIDDER'S NAME AND ADDRESS	YEARLY APPROX QTY.	I.C.S. JAIL SUPPLIES P.O. BOX 21058, WACO, TX. 76702 (800) 524-5427		VICTORY SUPPLY 7025 INDUSTRIAL PARK RD., MOUNT PLEASANT, TN 38474 (888) 376-1205		CHARM TEX 1818 CONEY ISLAND AVENUE, BROOKLYN, NY 11230 (718) 252-8100		BOB BARKER CO. 7925 PURFOY RD., FUQUAY VARIN, N.C. 27526 (800) 334-9880			
DESCRIPTION		UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE		
A. PATROL UNIFORMS											
A-1. Shirts - Long Sleeve - M	210	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
A-2. Pants - M	210	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
A-3. Shirts - Long Sleeve - F	210	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
A-4. Pants - F	60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
A-5. Shirts - Short Sleeve - M	60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
A-6. Shirts - Short Sleeve - F	60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
A-7. Patrol Armor Skin X-P	260										
A. TOTAL			NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		
B. JAIL GUARDS											
B-1. Shirts - Short Sleeve-M/F	330	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
B-2. Shirts - Long Sleeve - M/F	60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
B-3. Pants - M	60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
B-4. Pants - F	60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
B. TOTAL			NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		
C. INMATE COVERALLS & UNIFORMS											
C-1. Coveralls				*Price Increase							
White, Dark Blue (S-XL)	70	\$21.67	\$1,516.90	\$13.69	\$14.24	\$958.30	\$13.90	\$973.00	\$13.99	\$979.30	
White, Dark Blue (2X)	6	\$21.67	\$108.35	\$13.69	\$14.24	\$86.45	\$13.90	\$89.50	\$13.99	\$89.95	
Orange, Green (S-XL)	600	\$21.67	\$13,002.00	\$13.69	\$14.24	\$8,214.00	\$13.80	\$8,340.00	\$13.99	\$8,394.00	
Orange, Green (2X)	100	\$21.67	\$2,167.00	\$13.69	\$14.24	\$1,389.00	\$13.80	\$1,390.00	\$13.99	\$1,399.00	
Red, Silver, Tan (S-XL)	16	\$21.67	\$325.05	\$13.69	\$14.24	\$205.35	\$13.90	\$208.50	\$13.99	\$209.85	
Red, Silver, Tan (2X)	10	\$21.67	\$216.70	\$13.69	\$14.24	\$138.90	\$13.80	\$139.00	\$13.99	\$139.90	
C-2. V-Neck Shirts											
Orange, Red, Green (S-2X)	10	\$11.72	\$117.20	\$5.74	\$5.94	\$57.40	\$8.18	\$81.80	\$5.88	\$59.80	
White, Blue, Silver, Tan (S-2X)	160	\$11.72	\$1,758.00	\$5.74	\$5.94	\$881.00	\$8.18	\$827.00	\$5.88	\$897.00	
C-3. Work Pants											
Orange, Red, Green (S-2X)	10	\$11.32	\$113.20	\$5.86	\$6.09	\$58.60	\$8.38	\$83.60	\$8.82	\$88.20	
White, Blue, Silver, Tan (S-2X)	160	\$11.32	\$1,898.00	\$5.86	\$6.09	\$849.00	\$8.38	\$854.00	\$8.82	\$1,023.00	
C. TOTAL			\$21,022.40		\$6.09	\$12,775.70		\$13,128.40		\$13,240.00	
D. INMATE SANDALS SHR.	2000	\$3.15	\$6,300.00	2.17	\$4,340.00	\$4,340.00	\$1.84	\$2.28	\$3,280.00	\$2.49	\$4,980.00
E. PATROL JACKETS	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
MISC. DISCOUNT OFF LIST			10%					5%		15%	

RECOMMENDATION

*1 - Dept. has issues with delivery time

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED.

MICHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE 6/28/21

RECOMMENDATION:  DATE 06/29/2021
 ERIC GARZA, SHERIFF
 RECOMMENDATION:  DATE 06/29/2021
 JOE ELIZARDI, CHIEF JAILER
 CARLOS DEL BOSQUE, LIEUTENANT/SHERIFF'S

**Awarded by Commissioners' Court
on 07/06/2021**

TABULATION

Month-to-Month Renewal

Term: July 2nd, 2024 to February 28th, 2025

ANNUAL BID #2660 - UNIFORMS: SHERIFF'S / JAILER/ INMATES.

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JUNE 8, 2021 AT 11:00 AM

FROM: AWARD DATE TO: JUNE 15, 2022 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL.

****Price Increase effective July 2nd, 2024**

BIDDER'S NAME AND ADDRESS	Y EARLY APPROX QTY.	GALLS 1340 RUSSELL CAVE RD., LEXINGTON, KY 40505 (800) 878-4242		GT DISTRIBUTORS 2545 BROCKTON DR., S# 100 AUSTIN, TX. 78758 (512) 461-8298	
		UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
A. PATROL UNIFORMS					
**Price Increase					
A-1. Shirts - Long Sleeve - M	210	\$58.00	\$69.97	\$12,180.00	\$49.00 \$10,290.00
A-2. Pants - M	210	\$62.00	\$62.51	\$10,920.00	\$85.00 \$13,850.00
A-3. Shirts - Long Sleeve - F	210	\$58.00	\$69.72	\$12,180.00	\$49.00 \$10,290.00
A-4. Pants - F	80	\$52.00	\$62.51	\$3,120.00	\$85.00 \$3,900.00
A-5. Shirts - Short Sleeve - M	80	\$42.00	\$50.48	\$2,520.00	\$38.99 \$2,339.40
A-6. Shirts - Short Sleeve - F	80	\$42.00	50.48	\$2,520.00	\$38.99 \$2,339.40
A-7. Patrol Armor Skin X-P	280	\$99.00	\$119.01	\$24,750.00	\$107.99 \$26,997.50
A. TOTAL				\$68,190.00	\$69,806.30
B. JAIL GUARDS					
**Price Increase					
B-1. Shirts - Short Sleeve-M/F	330	\$30.00	\$36.06	\$9,900.00	NO BID NO BID
B-2. Shirts - Long Sleeve - M/F	50	\$32.00	\$38.46	\$1,800.00	NO BID NO BID
B-3. Pants - M	80	\$30.00	\$36.06	\$1,800.00	NO BID NO BID
B-4. Pants - F	100	\$30.00	\$36.06	\$1,800.00	NO BID NO BID
B-5. Flannel Wind Braeaker		\$24.50	\$29.45		NO BID NO BID
B. TOTAL				\$15,100.00	NO BID
C. INMATE COVERALLS & UNIFORMS					
C-1. Coveralls					
White, Dark Blue (S-XL)	70	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
White, Dark Blue (2X)	5	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
Orange, Green (S-XL)	800	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
Orange, Green (2X)	100	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
Red, Silver & Tan (S-XL)	15	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
Red, Silver, Tan (2X)	10				
C-2. V-Neck Shirts					
Orange, Red, Green (S-2X)	10	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
White, Blue, Silver, Tan (S-2X)	150	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
C-3. Work Pants					
Orange, Red, Green (S-2X)	10	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
White, Blue, Silver, Tan (S-2X)	150	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
C. TOTAL			**Price Increase	NO BID	NO BID
D. INMATE SANDALS SHR.	200	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
E. PATROL JACKETS	20	\$135.00	\$141.75	\$2,700.00	NO BID
MISC. DISCOUNT OFF LIST				20%	

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED.

MICHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT 6/28/21 DATE

RECOMMENDATION
ERIC GARZA SHERIFF

RECOMMENDATION
JOE ELIZARDI CHIEF JAILER DATE
CARLOS DEL BOSQUE LIEUTENANT/SHERIFF'S

Awarded by Commissioners' Court on 07/06/2021