Renewed to 07/31/2025

TABULATION

ANNUAL BID #1700 - RENTAL EQUIPMENT SERVICES (EVENTS)
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JULY 12, 2022 AT 11:00 A.M.
FROM: AUGUST 2, 2022 TO: JULY 31, 2023 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - EACH RENEWAL ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR .

VENDOR'S NAME RENTAL WORLD, LLC COASTAL EVENT RENTALS LLC
& 2134 CENTRAL BLVD. 31047 HWY 100
ADDRESS BROWNSVILLE, TX 78520 LOS FRESNOS, TX 78566
(956) 542-7200 (956) 434-2586
DESCRIPTION
A} 6SKVA Prime output, portable trailer-towable Diesel Generator:
1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) —» 564675 NO BID
2. TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) $1.043.50 NO BID
3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) — , $1,44025 NO BID
B) 125KVA Prima output, portable trail Diesel
1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) — $819.25 NO BID
2. TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) 1— $1,38850 NO BID
3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) —  $1.957.75 NO BID
C) 6-8 KW Portable tralle: Telescopic Light Tower 28 {t Minimum Hliihlz
1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) $276.50 — $150.00
2 TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) $403.00 —_— $300.00
3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) $529.50 [ $450.00

D) 41,000 BTU Upright Propane Outdoor Heater:

1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) J——  $217.25 NO BID
2. TWO {2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) ; —  $303.50 NO BiD
3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) —»  $389.75 NO BID
E) Interlocking Steel crowd control 8FT SECTIONS

1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) $30.00 PLASTIC — $14.00
2. TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) $40.00 PLASTIC — $21.00
3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN, 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) $50 00 PLASTIC — $26.00

NON-RESPONSIVE

F} Interiocking Plastic crowd control Barricades: 6FT SECTIONS

1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) —» %3000 NO BID
2. TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) — $40.00 NO BID
3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) — $50.00 NO BID
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Renewed to 07/31/2025

TABULATION

ANNUAL BID #1700 - RENTAL EQUIPMENT SERVICES (EVENTS)
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JULY 12, 2022 AT 11:00 A.M.
FROM: AUGUST 2, 2022 TO: JULY 31, 2023 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - EACH RENEWAL ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR ,

VENDOR'S NAME RENTAL WORLD, LLC COASTAL EVENT RENTALS LLC
& 2134 CENTRAL BLVD. 31047 HWY 100
ADDRESS BROWNSVILLE, TX 78520 LOS FRESNOS, TX 78566
(956) 542-7200 (956) 434-2586
DESCRIPTION

G) Temporary Perimeter Chain-link Fence Panels:

1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) — $26.67 —> $20.00
2. TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) — $26.67 — $30.00
3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) —»  $2667 > $40.00
H) Rectangular Folding quet Table: 6x30

1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) $20.00 — $7.00
2._TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) ' $30.00 — $10.50
3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) d $35.00 — $14.00

I} Rectangular Folding Classroom Table: 6x18

1. ONE {1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) $25.00 — $10.00
2. TWO ({2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN, 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) $35.00 — $15.00
3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) $40.00 — $20.00

J) Metal Foldable chair (event chair): White Colar

1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. B HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) $4 00 — $1.00
2._TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) $5.00 — $1.50
3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) $6.00 —— $2.00

K] Metal Foldable chair (event chair): Black or Black Color

1. ONE {1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) $4 00 — $1.00
2. TWO {2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN, 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) $5.00 — $1.50
3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) $6.00 — $2.00

L} Frame/Cable Tent: 10x20

1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) $450.00 : $200.00
2. TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) i $475.00 — $300.00
3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) $500.00 — $400.00
RECOMMENDATION I
|/-! BY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:

7 7/ e[ 72>
MICHA ; AQT AUDITOR TPHRCHASING DATE

=

RA , DIRECTOR OF MARKETING AMPHITHEATRE 2

Awarded by Commissioners' Court
on 08/02/2022



Renewed to 07/31/2025

TABULATION

ANNUAL BID #1700 - RENTAL EQUIPMENT SERVICES (EVENTS)
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JULY 12, 2022 AT 11:00 A.M.
FROM: AUGUST 2, 2022 TO: JULY 31, 2023 W/OPTION TO'RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - EACH RENEWAL ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR .

VENDOR'S NAME RENTAL WORLD, LLC COASTAL EVENT RENTALS LLC
& 2134 CENTRAL BLVD 31047 HWY 100
ADDRESS BROWNSVILLE, TX 78520 LOS FRESNOS, TX 78566
(956) 542-7200 (956) 434-2586
DESCRIPTION
M) Frame/Cable Tent: 20x20
1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) $500.00 —»  $240.00
2. TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) $550.00 — $360.00
3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) $600.00 —»  $4B80.00
M) Frame & Anchor Tent: 10x10
1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL {(BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) $300.00 — $140.00
2. TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) ’ $325.00 — $210.00
3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) : $350.00 — $280.00
0) Frame & Anchor Tent: 20x20
1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) $500.00 —» $240.00
2. TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) $550.00 —»  $360.00
3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) $600.00 —_  $480.00
MISCELLANEOUS RENTALS: PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FROM VENDOR'S RENTAL CATALOG LIST 0% 0%

(Cost increase adjustment of 3% max annual price mcrease)
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