TABULATION

ANNUAL BID # 2430 - MOSQUITO INSECTICIDE
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: DECEMBER 22, 2020 AT 19:00 AM.
FROM: MARCH 16, 2021 TO: MARCH 15, 2022 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

VENDOR'S NAME CLARKE MGSQUITO VESER!S AAPCC ] TARGET SPECIALTY

& 675 SIDWELL CY | 125 NORTH G ST, 55C AERC LANE 1225 N POST CAKRD

ADDRESS ST CHARLES. Il 63174 HARLINGEN, TX 7855 SANFORD. FL. 32771 HOUSTON, TX. 77853

DESCRIPTION um {800) 323-5727 (713} 203-0436 {407} 328 8519 {225) 241-5670
| 18% Resmethrin, 54% Piperonyl Butaxide - S gai/pail QAL NO BID i $228.54 $565.30 NO BID
2 4% Resmethrin, 12% Piperanyl Butoxide - {Ready to use = RTU) 55 gal/drum GAL NO BID —*  $21425 NQ 8ID NO BID
3, Oil - base Permelkirin RTU, min 4% Permethnin, 8% Piperony) Butoxide - (S5 gal Drum) GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID —  $34.00
4 Qil-based pyretheoids - min. 1.5% Otl-based Permethrin, 7.5% Pipetonyl Butoxide - Ready to use (55 gai Drum} GAL $65.83 NO BID —— $42.00 NO BID
3. Oil-based Permethrin RTUL min. 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperony] Butoxide - - Ready 1o Usz (55 gal) Drum GAL $21.00 $16.50 . —» 315.55 $22.94
6. Oil-based Permethrin RTU, min. 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperonyl Butoxide - Readyta Use - 2X 2.5 gall GAL $21.00 —_— $16.50 $16.55 $22.04
7. Oil-based Permethrin RTU, min. 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperonyl Butoxide - Ready to Use - ( 275 gals) Mif SAL $21.00 $17.95 — 51455_ $22 94
8. Qil-based Permethrin Concentrats, min. 30% Permethrin, 30% Piperonly Butoxide - 5 gal/pail GAL $65.00 $67.45 $94 00 e $5G,75
9 Oil-based Permethrin Concentrate min 1% Permathrin, 66% Piperonyl Butoxide - per/gal GAL NO BID 92.55 $125.00 —  $81.15
10, Chlorpyrifos 15 Ibfgal RTU - 55 gal daum GAL | —» 34500 NOC BID $55.61 NO 8i0
11 Chlorpyrifos | 5 lvgal RTU -2 5:gal drum GAL NO BIO $66.00 -+ $58.37 NO 810
12 Alosid Briguets (220 cat) - 150 days (Open Market Price Increases allowed) BX $759.00 —* $759.00 1 NO BID $759.00
13, Altosid Briquéts {300 ent )-30days  (Open Market Price Increases allowed} ax $480.00 — $480.00 *1 NO BID $480.00
14, Alwside Pro G 1 5% Methoprene (24 pres)- xx days (Open Market Price Increase allowed) Cs | —» $134.88 $164.49 NGO BID 5163.08
15 Altoside Pro & 1.5% Methoprene (12 prcs) - xx days {Open Market Price Increase allowed) CS | —» $277.20 $338.05 NQ BID $342.65
16 Bactimos Briauets (100 pribox) - 30 doys ax $79.00 I $78.00 NO 8ID $89.34
17 Briquets - 6% Bacilus Sphaericus, 1% Bacilius thuringiensis (200 ¢nt) - 45 day BX |—— §$284.60 NC BID $1,330.60 NO BID
18. EPA Approved Diluent Qil for Mosquito Control - 55 galidrum GAL $8.90 — $6.76 $7.24 $7.05

{9 Aquabac (200G) Bacilus Thuringeiensis 2.86% BAG NO BID $78.40 $74.40 — 371.60
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