TABULATION

ANNUAL BIDS - ROAD MATERIALS: CONCRETE # 2510

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON FEBRUARY 25, 2020, AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM: AWARD DATE TO: FEBRUARY 18, 2021 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.
OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

BIDDER'S NAME CEMEX
AND 3710 S. EXPR. 281,
ADDRESS EDINBURG, TX. 78542
DESCRIPTION (956) 386-1452

price per/ cubic yard

1. A. Class A Concrete - 3000 P.S.I. Min.

1. Zone 1 — $150.00
2. Zone 2 i $150.00
3. Zone 3 — $150.00
4. Zone 4 — $150.00
5. Zone 5 — $150.00

B. Class B Concrete - 2000 P.S.l. Min.

1.Zone 1 — $145.00
2. Zone 2 — $145.00
3.Zone 3 — $145.00
4, Zone 4 —b $145.00
5.Zone 5 — $145.00

C. Class C Concrete - 3600 P.S.1. Min.

1. Zone 1 — $160.00
2. Zone 2 e $160.00
3. Zone 3 — $160.00
4. Zone 4 — $160.00
5. Zone 5 — $160.00

D. Class D Concrete - 1500 P.S 1. Min,

1. Zone 1 NO BID
2. Zone 2 NO BID
3.Zone 3 NO BID
4. Zone 4 NO BID
5. Zone 5 NO BID

2. A. Cement Treatment (Road Mixed)

1. Zone 1 NO BID
2. Zone 2 NO BID
3. Zone 3 NO BID
4. Zone 4 NO BID
5. Zone 5 NO BID

3. A. Cement Flowable Backfill 80-150 P.S.I.

1. Zone 1 — $140.00
2. Zone 2 — $140.00
3.Zone 3 —> $140.00
4. Zone 4 — $140.00
5.Zone 5 — $140.00

Demurrage 2+ hrs
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Approved by Commissioners' Court on 3/3/2020
Pending Contract Negotiations



